Western Conveyance
Water Service Connection Materials Bid #16-0121W

Potomac Valley L/B Water Service The CI Thornburg
Industrial Supply Inc H D Supply Co., Inc.

Item [Description Qty | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price| Total
1A [3/4" Pressure Regulator 300 $57.24 | $17,172.00 | $59.70 | $17,910.00 | $44.00 | $13,200.00 | $44.00 | $13,200.00
1B |1" Pressure Regulator 50 $79.92 $3,996.00 $86.60 $4,330.00 $90.00 $4,500.00 $90.00 | $4,500.00
2A [3/4" H.P. Copper Setter 300 | $197.53 | $59,259.00 | $185.85 | $55,755.00 | $180.50 | $54,150.00 | $199.00 | $59,700.00
2B |1" H.P. Copper Setter 50 $383.25 | $19,162.50 | $361.75 | $18,087.50 | $351.40 | $17,570.00 | $374.00 | $18,700.00
3A |Meter Box Cover & Frame Assembly 18" 300 $54.54 | $16,362.00 | No Bid No Bid $50.90 | $15,270.00 | $51.00 | $15,300.00
3B |Meter Box Cover Only 20" 50 $22.15 $1,107.50 No Bid No Bid $20.45 $1,022.50 [ $21.00 | $1,050.00
3C [Meter Box Frame Only 20" 50 $54.97 $2,748.50 No Bid No Bid $51.40 $2,570.00 | $51.00 | $2,550.00
4A |Meter Box 18"x22"x30" 300 No Bid No Bid $64.00 $19,200.00 | $62.00 $18,600.00 | $62.00 | $18,600.00
4B [Meter Box 20"x24"x30" 50 No Bid No Bid $93.45 $4,672.50 $90.70 $4,535.00 | $91.00 | $4,550.00

Grand Total $119,807.50 $119,955.00 $131,417.50 $138,150.00

Number of Calendar Day to Supply and Deliver ;

Material Required after Receipt of Order 3 to 4 Weeks 2 to 10 Weeks See Notes

Notes: H.D. Supply - Carson Industries, Boxes 8 to 10 wks, A.Y. McDonald, Lids 2 to 3 wks, Ford Meter Bos, Setters 3 to 4 wks, Wilkins Regulators

2 to 3 wks

CI Thornburg, Co. - Meter Box lead time 60 - 90 days, Pressure Regulators lead time 10 - 20 days, Setter lead time 90 - 120 days, A.Y. Lid lead time

10-15 days.




