Custodial Cleaning & Paper Products

Bid #180621CC Bid Tabulation

Item # Janitor Supply | A.F. Wendling | Pepper’s Inc. Interboro Naylors Pyramid School | Central Poly| *All American
Packaging Products Poly
P1 Mont Royal/Metro Toilet Tissue ONLY 30.59 33.07 39.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.70 No Bid
P2 Scott/Nittany Multifold Hand Towels ONLY 22.68 18.25 21.50 No Bid 54.00 No Bid 15.66 No Bid
P3 Cascades Pro Select/White Swan/Etiquette 17.13 19.50 17.50 No Bid 27.99 No Bid 18.70 No Bid
Roll Towels ONLY
P4 8 oz. Foam Cups 24.17 22.58 22.95 No Bid 35.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
P5 12 oz. Foam Cups 33.88 32.03 32.55 No Bid 50.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
P6 Natural Roll Towels 22.27 31.80 17.75 No Bid 35.72 No Bid 17.66 No Bid
P7 Toilet Tissue 21.23 22.75 21.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.77 No Bid
L1 24 x 24 Trash Liners 11.85 15.45 No Bid 17.82 No Bid No Bid 19.00 18.99
L2 30 x 36 Trash Liners 13.49 12.99 No Bid 13.98 No Bid No Bid 18.00 17.80
L3 38 x 58 Trash Liners 1.5 mil 14.36 25.60 No Bid 19.74 No Bid No Bid 18.40 15.07
C1 SparCling Toilet Bowl Cleaner ONLY 24.30 No Bid 26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C2 Liquid Hand Soap 24.36 43.85 27.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C3 Chlorine Bleach 9.05 11.26 No Bid No Bid 14.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid
C4 Laundry Detergent 50 Ibs. 19.41 34.25 32.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C5 Spartan TNT Foam Cleaner ONLY 31.17 No Bid 39.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C6 General Purpose Cleaner 19.75 46.77 36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C7 Sprayway Foam Glass Cleaner ONLY 18.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8 Wash Bryte Liquid Laundry Detergent ONLY No Bid No Bid 45.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
M1 Spray Disinfectant 23.40 78.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.98 No Bid No Bid
G1 Nitrile Exam Gloves - X-Large 3.63 39.97 4.13 3.90 No Bid 3.93 No Bid No Bid
G2 Nitrile Exam Gloves — Large 3.63 39.97 4.13 3.90 No Bid 3.93 No Bid No Bid
G3 Nitrile Exam Gloves - Medium 3.63 39.97 4.13 3.90 No Bid 3.93 No Bid No Bid
G4 Nitrile Exam Gloves - Small 3.63 39.97 4.13 3.90 No Bid 3.93 No Bid No Bid
Minimum Order 50.00 250.00 0 0 25.00 12 Pallet
Delivery Schedule Every 2 Weeks Weekly on Bi-Weekly 5-7 Days ARO 5-20 Days
Thursday Thursday ARO
Deliveries

Notes: Peppers - Vehicle emergencies or inclement weather - deliveries will be rescheduled to best suit customer’s needs. Sales rep will make special deliveries when needed.
Pyramid - Items G1 - G4, 10 boxes/case, you must purchase FULL CASES ONLY
*All American Poly - Non responsive bid because it was not submitted on the correct Bid Proposal Page.





