Motor Oil and Grease
Bid #19-0502MO Bid Tabulation

Bruceton PPC Lubricants | Garrett Industrial | RR] Enterprises

Petroleum Co. Supply
5W-30 Motor Oil Compass Drydene Syn Bel-Ray Bex No Bid
Brand Name Blend Plus
Gallon 5.94 5.19 8.38 No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 446.88 337.70 460.95 No Bid
Quart 2.50 Mag 1 3.50 2.44 No Bid
10W-30 Motor Oil Mag 1 Drydene Syn Bel-Ray Bex No Bid
Brand Name Blend Plus
Quart 2.49 3.50 2.43 No Bid
15W-40 Motor Oil Compass Drydene Diesel | Bel-Ray Hyperion No Bid
Brand Name All
Gallon 7.49 6.55 7.58 No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 476.43 398.75 448.22 No Bid
5 Gallon Pail 46.44 46.50 9.71 No Bid
Quart 3.25 4.39 No Bid No Bid
85W-140 Gear Lubricant Compass Peak Bel-Ray No Bid
Brand Name
Gallon 8.38 8.19 No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 572.69 491.70 No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Pail 54.81 55.70 49.98 No Bid
120 LB. Keg 197.40 205.28 16 gal keg 183.82 No Bid
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid Compass Drydene Bel-Ray Premium No Bid
Brand Name Universal
Gallon 6.11 5.34 No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 376.75 345.95 No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Pail 38.94 41.70 31.84 No Bid
Quart 9.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 Shell RT-2 Shell Rotella T3 No Bid No Bid
Heavy Duty Engine Oil Fleet
Brand Name
Gallon 9.38 8.04 No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 550.00 483.45 No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Pail 56.13 54.95 No Bid No Bid
Quart 2.84 451 No Bid No Bid
Transmission Fluid Compass TO-4 | Drydene Trans Bel-Ray TO-4 No Bid
Brand Name All
Gallon 7.94 6.78 No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 514.94 425.15 493.83 No Bid
5 Gallon Pail 48.32 48.90 51.05 No Bid




Bruceton PPC Lubricants | Garrett Industrial | RR] Enterprises
Petroleum Co. Supply

Quart No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Multipurpose Lithium Texas Red Drydene Super S Hi-Temp No Bid
Complex Grease Retraplex Ruby
Brand Name Red
Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 968.75 860.00 400 Ib. No Bid No Bid
120 LB. Keg 259.50 274.80 251.25 No Bid
Tube 2.29 3.30 2.14 No Bid
10W-40 Motor Oil Compass Peak No Bid No Bid
Brand Name
Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 375.38 458.70 No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Quart 2.50 Mag 1 3.89 No Bid No Bid
80W-90 High Performance Compass Drydene Gear Bel-Ray Amsoil
Gear Oil Brand Name All
Gallon 9.12 8.72 No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 572.69 497.20 No Bid 1,825.00
120 LB. Keg 182.20 174.72 16 gal 171.05 575.00

keg
Tube No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bottle (32 oz.) 4.00 4.52 Mag 1 3.24 10.75
Power Steering Fluid Berkebile 2+2 Mag 1 No Bid No Bid
Brand Name
Gallon Bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Quart 2.65 3.78 No Bid No Bid
5W-20 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Compass Drydene Syn Bel-Ray Bex Amsoil OE
Motor Qil Brand Name Blend
Gallon 5.94 5.19 No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 446.88 337.70 382.78 1,255.00
120 LB. Keg No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Pail No Bid 4.95 No Bid No Bid
1 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.25
Quart 2.50 Mag 1 3.50 2.05 6.65
5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Compass Drydene Syn Bel-Ray Bex Amsoil OE
Motor Qil Brand Name Blend Plus
Gallon 5.94 5.19 No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 446.88 337.70 386.33 1,275.00
120 LB. Keg No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Pail No Bid 40.95 No Bid No Bid
1 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.75
Quart 2.50 Mag 1 3.50 2.07 6.75
80W-140 Synthetic Gear Compass Sunoco Dura No Bid Amsoil Long Life
Brand Name Gear




Bruceton PPC Lubricants Garrett RR] Enterprises
Petroleum Co. Industrial Supply
Gallon 17.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 1,038.13 1,286.45 No Bid 2,335.00
5 Gallon Pail 103.69 141.95 No Bid 255.00
120 LB. Keg 310.00 424.64 No Bid 745.00
CD-50 Synthetic Gear Compass Sunoco Dura No Bid No Bid
Brand Name Trans FE
Gallon 14.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 877.25 1,942.60 No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Pail 96.75 205.65 No Bid No Bid
120 LB. Keg 275.80 615.52 No Bid No Bid
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) Blue Jay No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Name
Gallon (various sized totes) 2.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
250 Gallon Tote 550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Bottle 8.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2/2.5 gal bottle
1 Gallon Bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Notes: Bruceton Petroleum - Bidding Shell RT2 15W40. Quarts are sold by a 6 qt case. Grease tubes are sold in a 10-pk

RRJ Enterprises - Product Literature attached. RR] Enterprises is an Independent Dealer of Ansoil Inc. Products.
Product Warranty Statement attached.





