Motor Oil and Grease
Bid #17-0525MO Bid Tabulation

BEFES Foods PPC Lubricants, Inc.
Bruceton Petroleum
5W-30 Motor Oil Multiguard Dexos 1 Peak Syn Blend 5w30
Brand Name Full Synthetic
Gallon 6.84 4.90
55 Gallon Drum 394.10 291.50
Quart No Bid 2.75
10W-30 Motor Oil Multiguard Formula 500 Peak 10w30 GF-5
Brand Name Syn. Blend
Quart 2.25 2.66
15W-40 Motor Oil Multiguard Premium Peak 10w40 CK-4
Brand Name 15w40 CJ4
Gallon 5.15 6.17
55 Gallon Drum 314.60 361.35
5 Gallon Pail 34.15 39.60
Quart 2.75 3.20
85W-140 Gear Lubricant Multiguard HD, Peak 85w140
Brand Name EP GL-5 85w140
Gallon 7.10 7.48
55 Gallon Drum 408.00 433.40
5 Gallon Pail 40.14 46.15
120 LB. Keg 156.90 187.84 16 gallon
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid Multiguard Premium Mag UTF
Brand Name UTH Fluid
Gallon 4.56 4.67
55 Gallon Drum 275.00 278.85
5 Gallon Pail 31.95 32.10
Quart 4.39 8.84 gallon
3/1 gal/case

Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 Shell Rotella T-3 Shell Rotella T3 Fleet
Heavy Duty Engine Oil 15w40 CJ4 15w40 CK-4
Brand Name
Gallon 9.98 9.41
55 Gallon Drum 654.00 539.55
5 Gallon Pail 61.95 55.80
Quart 3.95 4.31

Shell Rotella T4 Triple Protection
15w40 CK-4 12/1qgt/case

Transmission Fluid

Multiguard Transmission

Mag 1 T0-4 30w

Brand Name Fluid TO4

Gallon 5.59 6.07
55 Gallon Drum 329.00 355.85
5 Gallon Pail 33.95 39.10




Quart

No Bid

No Bid

Multipurpose Lithium Complex
Grease Brand Name

Valvoline Cerulean

Sunoco Tacky Red Grease #2

Gallon No Bid No Bid
55 Gallon Drum No Bid 840.00

400 LB Drum
120 LB. Keg 385.00 294.00
Tube 3.19 3.29
10W-40 Motor Oil Multiguard Prem. Mag 1 10w40
Brand Name Syn. Blend 10w40
Gallon No Bid 6.75
55 Gallon Drum 319.00 371.25
5 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid
Quart 2.09 2.39

6/1 qt/case
80W-90 High Performance Gear Multiguard HP GL-5 Mag 1 80w90
Oil  Brand Name 80w90
Gallon 7.29 8.97
Will pump from drums into tank
55 Gallon Drum 429.00 493.35
120 LB. Keg 143.95 172.16 16 gallon
Tube No Bid No Bid
Bottle (32 oz.) *9.24 gallon 3.34
6/1 gal/case
Power Steering Fluid Berkebile Mag 1
Brand Name Power Steering Fluid Power Steering Fluid
Gallon Bottle No Bid 8.29
4/1 gal/case
Quart 1.69 5.54
6/1qt/case

5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Multiguard Prem. Peak Syn Blend 5w30
Motor Qil Brand Name Syn. Blend 5w30
Gallon 4.09 4.90
55 Gallon Drum 259.00 291.50
120 LB. Keg No Bid No Bid
5 Gallon Pail No Bid 33.25
1 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid
Quart 2.09 2.75
80W-140 Synthetic Gear Multiguard Full Castrol Syn Gear 80w140
Brand Name Synthetic GL-5
Gallon 14.99 No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 847.25 1578.50

410 LB Drum
5 Gallon Pail 80.95 143.50

35 LB Pail

120 LB. Keg 264.95 477.60




CD-50 Synthetic Gear Multiguard Syn Castrol Syn Gear CD 50
Brand Name Trans. Fluid 50
Gallon 12.84 No Bid
55 Gallon Drum 686.50 1593.75
375 LB Drum

5 Gallon Pail 72.95 142.45

35 LB Pail
120 LB. Keg 234.95 484.00

110 LB Keg

Notes: BES - The multiguard brand of lubricants is currently the line being used by the State of West
Virginia Dept. of Highways, the WV State Police & the WV State Parks. Multiguard Products meet all of
the bid specifications that are required in the Garrett County bid. Quarts are sold by a 12 Qt. Case.
Grease tubes are sold in a 10 Pack.





