Fire Prevention Systems Services

Bid #23-1005 Bid Tabulation

Fire Protection

Section 1 ARK Systems Products
Fire Sprinkler Systems, Fire Pumps, Back Flow Preventers, Fire

Alarms and Hood Suppression Systems

Location 1 Garrett County Health Center

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $948.90 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $696.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Location 2 Garrett County Community Action Center

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $765.67 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $301.75 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Hood Suppression No Bid $120.00
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $55.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $65.00
Location 3 Garrett County Courthouse

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $765.67 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $657.05 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Hood Suppression No Bid $120.00
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) No Bid $55.00
Overtime Rate No Bid $65.00
Location 4 Garrett County Vistiors Center

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $278.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Location 5 Solid Waste and Recycling Division

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $278.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Location 6 Kitzmiller School

Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $273.25 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid




Fire Protection

ARK Systems Products
Location 7 Adventure Sports Center International
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $867.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $202.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Location 8 Garrett County Oakland Road Garage
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $376.76 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Location 9 Garrett County Emergency Operations Center
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $269.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $867.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Location 10 MEDCO Building
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $289.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $664.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Location 11 Board of Education Building/M&T Bank Building
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Alarms $260.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 AM. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Annual Recommended Maintenance for Sprinklers $477.00 No Bid
Repair per hour (8 A.M. to 5 P.M., M-F) $64.00 No Bid
Overtime Rate $84.00 No Bid
Discount for parts is % discount from list - 20%
is % markup from cost 25% 30%
Section 2 - Monitoring
Remote Monitoring Garrett County Health Center
Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 No Bid
Remote Monitoring Adventure Sports Center International
Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 No Bid
Remote Monitoring Kitzmiller School
Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 No Bid
Remote Monitoring Garrett County Animal Shelter
Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 No Bid
Remote Monitoring Garrett County EOC
Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 No Bid

Remote Monitoring MEDCO Building




Fire Protection

ARK Systems Products
Quarterly Monitoring Rate $150.00 No Bid
Remote Monitoring Board of Education Building
Quarterly Monitoring Rate $60.00 No Bid
Section 3 - Fire Extingisher Inspection and Services
A.21/21b. ABC No Bid $43.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $9.50
6 year Maintenance No Bid $9.50
Hydro Test No Bid $12.00
B.51b. ABC No Bid $60.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $13.50
6 year Maintenance No Bid $9.50
Hydro Test No Bid $12.00
C.101b. ABC No Bid $89.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $23.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid $9.50
Hydro Test No Bid $12.00
D. 20 1b. ABC No Bid $172.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $30.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid $9.50
Hydro Test No Bid $12.00
E.21/21b.CO2 No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid No Bid
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid
F.51b. CO2 No Bid $208.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $23.50
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
G. 101b. CO2 No Bid $298.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $26.95
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
H. 151b. CO2 No Bid $353.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $29.25
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
[. 20 1b. CO2 No Bid $428.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $33.80
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid




Fire Protection

ARK Systems Products
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
J.301b. CO2 No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Recharge No Bid No Bid
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid
K.21/2 1b. HALON No Bid $298.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $120.00*
6 year Maintenance No Bid $35.00
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
L.51b. HALON No Bid $473.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $260.00*
6 year Maintenance No Bid $47.00
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
M. 9 Ib. HALON No Bid $817.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $450.00*
6 year Maintenance No Bid $70.00
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
N. 10 Ib. HALON Corrected to 13 Ib No Bid $1,068.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $540.00*
6 year Maintenance No Bid $78.00
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
O.11b. BC No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Recharge No Bid No Bid
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid
P.51b BC No Bid $98.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $13.50
6 year Maintenance No Bid $9.50
Hydro Test No Bid $12.00
Q. 101b. BC No Bid $175.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $23.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid $9.50
Hydro Test No Bid $12.00
R.201b. BC No Bid $201.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $30.00
6 year Maintenance No Bid $9.50
Hydro Test No Bid $12.00
S.2.51bCG No Bid $255.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75




Fire Protection

ARK Systems Products
Recharge No Bid $128.00*
6 year Maintenance No Bid $34.00
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
T.51b CG No Bid $473.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $269.00*
6 year Maintenance No Bid $48.00
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
U.91b CG No Bid $1,068.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $450.00*
6 year Maintenance No Bid $70.00
Hydro Test No Bid $22.00
V.251b CG No Bid No Bid
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid No Bid
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid No Bid
W. 9 1b K-Guard No Bid $211.00
Maintenance No Bid $3.75
Recharge No Bid $157.50*
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid $12.00
X. 1251b PK No Bid $4,189.00
Maintenance No Bid $40.00
Recharge No Bid $700.00*
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid $395.00
Y. 110 Ib NIT No Bid $1,406.00
Maintenance No Bid $4.00
Recharge No Bid $17.45
6 year Maintenance No Bid No Bid
Hydro Test No Bid $39.70
Replacement Parts:
A. Gauge No Bid $6.75
B. Valve Stem No Bid $7.25
C."O" Ring No Bid $1.95
D. Nozzle No Bid $6.00
E. Hose Assembly No Bid $7.50
F. Siphon Tube No Bid $8.00
G. Wall Hanger No Bid $4.00
H. Vehicle Bracket No Bid $35.00
[. Collar Rings No Bid $1.50
J. Pull Pins No Bid $0.90
K. Cartridges No Bid List Price less 20%
L. Installation No Bid $3.00
M. Condemned No Bid $2.00




Fire Protection

ARK Systems Products
N. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Small No Bid $21.00
O. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Medium No Bid $22.00
P. Fire Extinguisher Cover - Large No Bid $24.00
Q. Weatherproof Tag No Bid $1.45
Minimum Stop Fee No Bid $35.00

Notes: Fire Protection Products

- * includes chemical.
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