
Contract Number - 19-0509F
Contract Title - Filters

Filter # Part Number
Estimated 
Quantity Brand Unit Price Total

Fuel Filters
1 33002 6 Wix $1.72 $10.32
2 33032 1 Wix $1.82 $1.82
3 33033 10 Wix $2.18 $21.80
4 33040 4 Wix $2.48 $9.92
5 33054 4 Wix $2.20 $8.80
6 33073 6 Wix $3.59 $21.54
7 33081 2 Wix $3.09 $6.18
8 33109 8 Wix $3.90 $31.20
9 33120 3 Wix $4.57 $13.71

10 33121 8 Wix $4.41 $35.28
11 33122 9 Wix $4.08 $36.72
12 33125 4 Wix $4.51 $18.04
13 33166 17 Wix $3.31 $56.27
14 33195 4 Wix $4.52 $18.08
15 33209 1 Wix $5.35 $5.35
16 33210 51 Wix $5.87 $299.37
17 33211 2 Wix $10.97 $21.94
18 33216 94 Wix $6.52 $612.88
19 33219 94 Wix $5.15 $484.10
20 33242 12 Wix $9.27 $111.24
21 33270 1 Wix $4.18 $4.18
22 33296 8 Wix $4.15 $33.20
23 33352 4 Wix $3.99 $15.96
24 33357 20 Wix $5.43 $108.60
25 33358 20 Wix $4.53 $90.60
26 33370 28 Wix $6.93 $194.04
27 33371 73 Wix $12.68 $925.64
28 33373 4 Wix $6.21 $24.84
29 33374 25 Wix $6.23 $155.75
30 33380 2 Wix $5.79 $11.58
31 33472 2 Wix $6.45 $12.90
32 33481 22 Wix $5.68 $124.96
33 33511 6 Wix $3.39 $20.34
34 33512 4 Wix $3.74 $14.96
35 33531 7 Wix $10.98 $76.86

36 33532 6 Wix $10.07 $60.42
37 33533 15 Wix $11.43 $171.45
38 33536 12 Wix $15.15 $181.80
39 33547 1 Wix $9.02 $9.02
40 33549 5 Wix $15.15 $75.75
41 33579 4 Wix $5.72 $22.88
42 33587 46 Wix $8.28 $380.88
43 33588 46 Wix $6.69 $307.74
44 33630 54 Wix $15.28 $825.12
45 33674 74 Wix $7.73 $572.02
46 36296 6 Wix $1.50 $9.00
47 3393 4 Wix $4.89 $19.56
48 3400 2 Wix $7.91 $15.82
49 3668 4 Wix $9.92 $39.68
50 3739 2 Wix $10.07 $20.14
51 3977 2 Wix $12.67 $25.34

Air Filters Wix Filter or approved equal
52 42098 4 Wix $3.77 $15.08
53 42119 1 Wix $20.70 $20.70
54 42124 3 Wix $21.48 $64.44
55 42126 5 Wix $11.20 $56.00
56 42222 1 Wix $10.14 $10.14
57 42234 2 Wix $17.00 $34.00
58 42237 1 Wix $17.82 $17.82
59 42276 2 Wix $8.89 $17.78
60 42321 13 Wix $18.73 $243.49
61 42329 2 Wix $5.60 $11.20
62 42382 16 Wix $28.81 $460.96
63 42383 12 Wix $13.64 $163.68
64 42488 2 Wix $8.45 $16.90
65 42518 2 Wix $14.38 $28.76
66 42519 2 Wix $11.68 $23.36
67 42522 4 Wix $21.94 $87.76
68 52533 2 Wix $24.79 $49.58
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69 42534 2 Wix $26.60 $53.20
70 42636 54 Wix $26.40 $1,425.60
71 42648 4 Wix $13.87 $55.48
72 42676 4 Wix $19.24 $76.96
73 42697 4 Wix $8.83 $35.32

74 42853 2 Wix $24.33 $48.66

75 42926 4 Wix $11.78 $47.12
76 42966 4 Wix $24.01 $96.04
77 42986 2 Wix $38.94 $77.88
78 43033 3 Wix $5.34 $16.02
79 46077 4 Wix $3.99 $15.96
80 46117 2 Wix $5.54 $11.08
81 46174 4 Wix $4.41 $17.64
82 46280 2 Wix $20.74 $41.48
83 46281 2 Wix $24.62 $49.24
84 46375 4 Wix $12.12 $48.48
85 46380 17 Wix $20.18 $343.06
86 46418 24 Wix $8.05 $193.20
87 46429 2 Wix $11.79 $23.58
88 46433 2 Wix $17.31 $34.62
89 46440 14 Wix $9.38 $131.32
90 46441 12 Wix $9.40 $112.80
91 46498 4 Wix $24.45 $97.80
92 46518 16 Wix $31.78 $508.48
93 46522 12 Wix $11.65 $139.80
94 46530 4 Wix $20.61 $82.44
95 46541 2 Wix $29.08 $58.16
96 46556 62 Wix $33.77 $2,093.74
97 46560 5 Wix $13.53 $67.65
98 46562 10 Wix $17.79 $177.90
99 46569 9 Wix $10.37 $93.33

100 46578 6 Wix $16.61 $99.66
101 46664 40 Wix $25.19 $1,007.60
102 46665 7 Wix $16.79 $117.53
103 46669 2 Wix $21.05 $42.10
104 46714 2 Wix No Bid No Bid
105 46744 4 Wix $20.36 $81.44
106 46782 4 Wix $16.38 $65.52
107 46784 12 Wix $38.56 $462.72
108 46785 12 Wix $22.96 $275.52
109 46845 3 Wix $18.61 $55.83
110 46883 3 Wix $32.13 $96.39
111 46886 8 Wix $24.63 $197.04
112 6139 4 Wix $3.33 $13.32

113 6937 4 Wix $32.19 $128.76

114 2487 4 Wix $8.34 $33.36
115 2797 3 Wix $4.43 $13.29
116 6496 3 Wix $20.92 $62.76
117 6489 4 Wix $15.57 $62.28
118 6754 3 Wix $14.06 $42.18
119 6836 3 Wix $29.06 $87.18
120 6837 3 Wix $24.97 $74.91

Oil Filter  Wix Filter or approved equal Dual Stage Type Filter
121 51036 22 Wix $2.59 $56.98
122 51042 18 Wix $2.85 $51.30
123 51050 2 Wix $3.44 $6.88
124 51060 12 Wix $2.62 $31.44
125 51061 16 Wix $2.98 $47.68
126 51064 4 Wix $3.96 $15.84
127 51068 14 Wix $2.45 $34.30
128 51069 6 Wix $2.62 $15.72
129 51085 6 Wix $2.65 $15.90
130 51106 4 Wix $6.19 $24.76
131 51110 4 Wix $4.29 $17.16
132 51133 3 Wix $4.57 $13.71
133 51138 6 Wix $4.34 $26.04
134 51168 2 Wix $5.25 $10.50
135 51189 3 Wix $5.25 $15.75
136 51197XE 1 Wix $20.83 $20.83
137 51243 10 Wix $3.28 $32.80
138 51290 22 Wix $17.57 $386.54
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139 51372 42 Wix $2.79 $117.18
140 51374 2 Wix $2.86 $5.72
141 51410 16 Wix $4.13 $66.08
142 51417 80 Wix $9.06 $724.80
143 51452 2 Wix $4.02 $8.04
144 51455 4 Wix $18.26 $73.04
145 51456 4 Wix $21.63 $86.52
146 51459 8 Wix $5.00 $40.00
147 51494 6 Wix $25.56 $153.36
148 51495 6 Wix $21.41 $128.46
149 51515 7 Wix $2.62 $18.34
150 51551 11 Wix $3.66 $40.26
151 51566 17 Wix $30.81 $523.77
152 51602 11 Wix $3.49 $38.39
153 51607 7 Wix $3.94 $27.58
154 51615 6 Wix $33.94 $203.64
155 51616 6 Wix $36.93 $221.58
156 51637 26 Wix $7.89 $205.14
157 51648 10 Wix $39.41 $394.10
158 51664 8 Wix $5.19 $41.52
159 51683 2 Wix $39.34 $78.68
160 51724 29 Wix $13.37 $387.73
161 51746 45 Wix $7.54 $339.30
162 51748 5 Wix $20.66 $103.30
163 51754 2 Wix $5.92 $11.84
164 51759 71 Wix $9.01 $639.71
165 51774 2 Wix $5.44 $10.88
166 51791 176 Wix $5.79 $1,019.04
167 51792 108 Wix $9.31 $1,005.48
168 51794 2 Wix $5.59 $11.18
169 51796 4 Wix $4.82 $19.28
170 51806 5 Wix $5.66 $28.30
171 51810 1 Wix $11.67 $11.67
172 51820 6 Wix $6.03 $36.18
173 51824 60 Wix $9.43 $565.80
174 51826 2 Wix $7.91 $15.82
175 51860 8 Wix $11.75 $94.00
176 51861 2 Wix $14.65 $29.30
177 51867 4 Wix $18.06 $72.24
178 51970 7 Wix $10.05 $70.35
179 51971 8 Wix $8.86 $70.88
180 57201 6 Wix $20.63 $123.78
181 57243 19 Wix $7.55 $143.45
182 57602 6 Wix $39.17 $235.02
183 1496 4 Wix $25.53 $102.12
184 1516 4 Wix $2.52 $10.08
185 1597 14 Wix $13.17 $184.38
186 1663 1 Wix $4.68 $4.68

Fuel/Water Wix Filter or approved equal
187 24070 10 Wix $4.96 $49.60
188 24071 18 Wix $5.84 $105.12
189 24428 48 Wix $5.48 $263.04

Miscellaneous Filters Oil Purolator-NAPA- Various Manufacturers
190 12222 10 Wix $2.68 $26.80

191 14006 25 Wix $2.85 $71.25

192 14670 15 Wix $2.65 $39.75
193 20195 10 Wix $2.52 $25.20
194 24011 15 Wix $2.59 $38.85
195 24651 20 Wix $2.79 $55.80
196 34631 6 Wix $2.62 $15.72
197 35399 6 Wix $5.31 $31.86
198 44872 6 Wix $7.95 $47.70
199 7182 6 Wix $5.94 $35.64
200 7750 12 Wix $7.68 $92.16
201 1522 12 Wix $2.88 $34.56
202 7213 12 Wix $12.16 $145.92
203 1630 6 Wix $3.01 $18.06
204 1453 12 Wix $4.77 $57.24
205 7730 6 Wix $3.89 $23.34
206 57182 4 Wix $5.94 $23.76

Miscellaneous Filters Air Purolator-NAPA- Various Manufacturers
207 24372 6 Wix $3.99 $23.94
208 24731 15 Wix $5.54 $83.10
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209 35414 10 Wix $5.60 $56.00
210 35528 6 Wix $10.36 $62.16
211 45314 25 Wix $8.34 $208.50
212 2489 4 Wix $12.59 $50.36
213 2803 10 Wix $33.83 $338.30
214 2804 10 Wix $19.29 $192.90
215 2795 8 Wix $15.65 $125.20
216 6036 4 Wix $2.88 $11.52
217 9131 10 Wix $36.66 $366.60
218 9132 10 Wix $39.58 $395.80
219 6981 75 Wix $9.32 $699.00
220 42803 4 Wix $33.83 $135.32
221 42804 4 Wix $19.29 $77.16

Miscellaneous Filters Fuel Purolator - NAPA - Various Manufacturers
222 55055 6 Wix $14.89 $89.34
223 55464 10 Wix $17.88 $178.80
224 3628 12 Wix $10.05 $120.60
225 3390 6 Wix $4.34 $26.04
226 3680 10 Wix $9.77 $97.70
227 3192 6 Wix $7.70 $46.20
228 3792 12 Wix $7.27 $87.24
229 33231 4 Wix $16.53 $66.12

Miscellaneous Filters Hydraulic Purolator - NAPA - Various Manufacturers
230 1772 4 Wix $5.53 $22.12

John Deere Filters ONLY (No Subsitute)
231 RE539465 4 John Deere $143.00 $572.00
232 RE533910 4 John Deere $176.00 $704.00
233 H216169 8 John Deere $44.30 $354.40
234 RE544804 4 John Deere $325.00 $1,300.00
235 RE544394 4 John Deere $56.00 $224.00
236 RE541922 4 John Deere $15.60 $62.40
237 AT101565 8 John Deere $7.37 $58.96
238 AT335492 4 John Deere $126.50 $506.00
239 AT367840 4 John Deere $113.25 $453.00
240 AM39653 4 John Deere $131.90 $527.60
241 AT335977 4 John Deere $240.00 $960.00
242 AT336140 4 John Deere $79.15 $316.60
243 AT225008 4 John Deere No Bid No Bid
244 AT367635 6 John Deere $8.70 $52.20
245 AT307274 4 John Deere No Bid No Bid
246 AT179323 4 John Deere $73.60 $294.40
247 RE504836 4 John Deere $23.40 $93.60
248 AT332908 4 John Deere $40.75 $163.00
249 AT332909 4 John Deere $29.63 $118.52
250 AT191102 4 John Deere $20.85 $83.40
251 AT184590 4 John Deere $45.95 $183.80

Vermeer Filters ONLY (No Subsitutes)
252 296299770 4 Vermeer $28.50 $114.00
253 180021944 4 Vermeer $69.95 $279.80
254 180021943 4 Vermeer $86.10 $344.40
255 180005675 4 Vermeer $32.95 $131.80
256 1820021162 4 Vermeer $131.00 $524.00
257 180021163 4 Vermeer $85.90 $343.60

$39,883.66Grand Total
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