
 
Contract Number-19-0502MO 

Contract Title-Motor Oil & Grease 
Attachment 1-Price Schedule 

 
 PPC Lubricants 

5W-30 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Drydene Syn Blend Plus 

Gallon 5.19 
55 Gallon Drum 337.70 
Quart 3.50 
10W-30 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Drydene Syn Blend Plus 

Quart 3.50 
15W-40 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Drydene Diesel All 

Gallon 6.55 
55 Gallon Drum 398.75 
5 Gallon Pail 46.50 
Quart 4.39 
85W-140 Gear Lubricant  
Brand Name 

Peak 

Gallon 8.19 
55 Gallon Drum 491.70 
5 Gallon Pail 55.70 
120 LB. Keg 205.28 16 gal keg 
Multipurpose Tractor Fluid 
Brand Name 

Drydene Universal 

Gallon 5.34 
55 Gallon Drum 345.95 
5 Gallon Pail 41.70 
Quart No Bid 
Shell Rotella (CJ-4) 15W-40 Heavy Duty 
Engine Oil       
Brand Name 

Shell Rotella T3 Fleet 

Gallon 8.04 
55 Gallon Drum 483.45 
5 Gallon Pail 54.95 

Quart 4.51 

Transmission Fluid 
Brand Name 

Drydene  Trans All  

Gallon 6.78 

55 Gallon Drum 425.15 
5 Gallon Pail 48.90 



 
 

PPC Lubricants 

Quart No Bid 
Multipurpose Lithium Complex Grease 
 Brand Name 

Drydene Retraplex Ruby Red 

Gallon No Bid 
55 Gallon Drum 860.00 400 lb. 
120 LB. Keg 274.80 
Tube 3.30 
10W-40 Motor Oil 
Brand Name 

Peak 

Gallon No Bid 
55 Gallon Drum 458.70 
5 Gallon Pail No Bid 
Quart 3.89 
80W-90 High Performance Gear Oil            
Brand Name 

Drydene Gear All 

Gallon 8.72 

55 Gallon Drum 497.20 

120 LB. Keg 174.72 16 gal keg 

Tube No Bid 

Bottle (32 oz.) 4.52 Mag 1 

Power Steering Fluid 
Brand Name 

Mag 1 

Gallon Bottle No Bid 
Quart 3.78 
5W-20 Synthetic Blend GF-5 
Motor Oil         Brand Name 

Drydene Syn Blend 

Gallon 5.19 
55 Gallon Drum 337.70 
120 LB. Keg No Bid 
5 Gallon Pail  40.95 
1 Gallon Pail No Bid 
Quart 3.50 
5W-30 Synthetic Blend GF-5 Motor Oil         
Brand Name 

Drydene Syn Blend Plus 

Gallon 5.19 
55 Gallon Drum 337.70 
120 LB. Keg No Bid 
5 Gallon Pail 40.95 
1 Gallon Pail No Bid 
Quart 3.50 
80W-140 Synthetic Gear 
Brand Name 

Sunoco Dura Gear 



 
 

PPC Lubricants 

Gallon No Bid 
55 Gallon Drum 1,286.45 
5 Gallon Pail 141.95 
120 LB. Keg 424.64 
CD-50 Synthetic Gear 
Brand Name 

Sunoco Dura Trans FE 

Gallon No Bid 
55 Gallon Drum 1,942.60 
5 Gallon Pail 205.65 
120 LB. Keg 615.52 
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) 
Brand Name 

Drydene Diesel All DEF 

Gallon (various sized totes) 1.59 
250 Gallon Tote 762.30 330 gal tote 
5 Gallon Bottle No Bid 
1 Gallon Bottle No Bid 

 
 




