Culvert Pipe Bid #21-0422C
Bid Tabulation

Galvanized Drainage Pipe - Plain

Chemung Supply Corp. Ferguson Enterprises Garrett Industrial Supply

Description | Gage | Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End | Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End | Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End
127 16 19.70 38.00 97.00 21.19 42.38 103.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" 16 23.75 41.25 124.00 2543 50.85 133.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” 16 29.60 59.00 156.00 31.79 63.57 167.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21" 16 33.50 67.00 192.00 36.01 72.04 205.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid
247 16 37.50 75.00 221.00 40.25 80.51 243.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" 16 417.50 95.00 430.00 50.85 101.70 462.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" 14 61.50 125.00 570.00 66.11 132.21 611.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
42 14 72.00 150.00 950.00 77.12 154.25 1020.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 14 82.00 165.00 1180.00 88.14 176.28 1265.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" 14 92.50 195.00 1390.00 99.16 198.32 1491.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" 12 170.00 350.00 1835.00 181.93 363.86 1971.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
66" 12 186.00 395.00 2440.00 199.73 399.46 2621.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" 12 195.00 425.00 2765.00 217.53 435.05 2971.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" 12 220.00 450.00 3470.00 235.32 470.65 3729.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
84" 10 290.00 575.00 3720.00 312.73 625.46 3962.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Polyethylene Corrugated Drainage Pipe

Chemung Supply Corp. Ferguson Enterprises Garrett Industrial Supply
Size Type Couplings Flared End Type Couplings Flared End Type Couplings Flared End
Smooth Sections Smooth Sections Smooth Sections
Interior Interior Interior
Diameter $/FT

12” 5.22 Included 136.12 5.23 8.52 136.39 6.14 10.00 160.14
15" 8.24 Included 136.12 8.26 14.22 136.39 9.69 16.69 160.14
18” 9.65 Included 182.17 9.67 24.20 182.48 11.35 28.41 214.32
24 16.99 Included 234.23 17.02 34.12 234.70 19.99 40.06 275.56
30” 23.82 Included 536.46 28.35 89.32 634.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" 35.20 Included 598.31 52.31 34.12 599.51 38.11 131.88 703.89
42" 37.58 Included N/A 41.37 181.90 905.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48” 56.75 Included N/A 52.31 191.56 1707.65 61.42 224.92 No Bid
54" N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60” 82.45 Included N/A 75.85 297.29 No Bid 89.24 349.75 No Bid
Bid is for in-ine bell type pipe Yes No Yes




Aluminized Drainage Pipe

Chemung Supply Corp. Ferguson Enterprises Garrett Industrial Supply
Description | Gage | Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End | Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End | Cost per Ft. Bands Flared End
12” 16 21.50 45.00 175.00 22.18 44.36 189.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” 16 25.90 55.00 205.00 26.61 53.22 209.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” 16 32.25 68.00 275.00 33.27 66.53 272.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" 16 41.00 85.00 300.00 42.14 84.28 294.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36” 14 68.00 135.00 1350.00 69.66 139.33 1196.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" 12 145.00 425.00 5900.00 225.29 450.58 5934.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid






