BOARD OF GARRETT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
PUBLIC MEETING
Monday, October 7, 2024

Meeting was also Live Streamed at https://www.facebook.com/garrettcountygovernment/

IN ATTENDANCE Chairman Paul C. Edwards
Commissioner Ryan S. Savage
Commissioner S. Larry Tichnell

County Administrator Kevin G. Null

ADMINISTRATIVE SESSION

«» BOARD APPOINTMENTS: The Board of County Commissioners, on a motion by Commissioner Savage, which
was seconded by Commissioner Tichnell, and made unanimous by Chairman Edwards, appointed the
following individuals:

- Garrett County Commission for Women — Bevian Hensley — 3-year term
- Garrett County Department of Social Services Advisory Board — Torey Moats — fulfilling the unexpired
term of Alisha Martin’s term ending on June 30, 2025.

An Official letter will be sent to each appointee under the signature of Chairman Edwards outlining the
terms of the appointment.

@,

% Mr. Null reviewed a number of administrative and managerial matters under his authority and jurisdiction
with the Board of County Commissioners.

CALL TO ORDER OF PUBLIC SESSION at 4:07 PM

PRAYER & PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE - Invocation by Commissioner Tichnell

PUBLIC SESSION

1. Mr. Null indicated there was no addition or deletion to the Public Meeting Agenda. The Board of County
Commissioners, on a motion by Commissioner Savage, which was seconded by Commissioner Tichnell,
and made unanimous by Chairman Edwards, approved the Public Meeting Agenda for October 7, 2024.

2. The Board of County Commissioners, on a motion by Commissioner Tichnell, which was seconded by
Commissioner Savage, and made unanimous by Chairman Edwards, approved the Public Meeting
Minutes of September 17, 2024.

3. Chairman Edwards announced that prior to the Public Meeting on this date, the Board of County
Commissioners on a motion by Commissioner Savage, which was seconded by Commissioner Tichnell and
made unanimous by Chairman Edwards, met in Executive Session under General Provisions Article 3-
305(b) of the Maryland Open Meetings Law to discuss personnel matters. The Executive Session ended
at 3:15 PM.

4. PROCLAMATIONS: / Can Swim Month — October 2024
Garrett County Economic Development Week — October 21-25, 2024

Public Meeting October 7, 2024 - Page 1 of 3


https://www.facebook.com/garrettcountygovernment/

5. APPROVAL:

The Board of County Commissioners, on a motion by Commissioner Savage, which was seconded by
Commissioner Tichnell, and made unanimous by Chairman Edwards, approved the following (attached):

+* Resolution 2024 — 9: Deep Creek Watershed Zoning Ordinance Amendment — Farm Winery
+* Resolution 2024 — 10: Sale of Property — Keyser’s Ridge Business Park

+* Resolution 2024 — 11: Covenants — Keyser’s Ridge Business Park

+* Resolution 2024 — 12: Garrett County Procurement — Bids and Contracts Ordinance

+* Resolution 2024 — 13: Garrett County Multi-Jurisdictional Hazard Mitigation Plan 2024

The Board of County Commissioners, on a motion by Commissioner Tichnell, which was seconded by
Commissioner Savage, and made unanimous by Chairman Edwards, approved the following (attached):

+* Resolution 2024 — 14: Ethics Ordinance 2024
+* ORDINANCE — Building Code Ordinance 2024
«* ORDINANCE — Mechanical Code Ordinance 2024

6. The Garrett County Department of Financial Services - Purchasing Division presented the following
recommendations for Bid Awards:

++ Garrett County Airport Rehabilitation Terminal Apron Project Contract No. 2024 — 01 Grant No.:3-
24-0023-021-2024
One (1) Bid response was received for this Bid: Carl Belt, Inc. - $822,555.00.
After reviewing the Bids for compliance with administrative requirements and based on the
feedback from the Garrett County Airport and funding approval from the Federal and Maryland

Aviation Administrations, the Garrett County Department of Financial Services — Purchasing Division
recommended awarding the Bid to Carl Belt, Inc. for $822,555.00.

This project is funded by the Federal/Maryland Aviation Administrations with an approximately 6%
or $49,353.30 local match requirement.

+ Bid #24-0919W - Winter Abrasives and Road Salt
Eleven (11) Bid responses were received for this Bid:

George’s Creek Stone & Gravel, Inc. Maryland Minerals, Inc.
Keystone Lime Company, Inc. - Eichorn Cargill, Inc.

Keystone Lime Company, Inc. — Cranesville Morton Salt, Inc.

Arcosa Aggregates Allegany Aggregates, Inc.
Fairfax Concrete Products Belmont Aggregates

Government MLO Supplies USA

After reviewing the Bids for compliance with administrative requirements and based on
feedback received from the Garrett County Department of Public Works — Roads Division, the
Purchasing Division recommended accepting the bids from the following vendors:

George’s Creek Stone & Gravel, Inc. Maryland Minerals, Inc.
Keystone Lime Company, Inc. - Eichorn Cargill, Inc.

Keystone Lime Company, Inc. — Cranesville Allegany Aggregates, Inc.
Arcosa Aggregates Belmont Aggregates

Fairfax Concrete Products

Public Meeting October 7, 2024 - Page 2 of 3



The Roads Division will determine the quarry to purchase winter abrasives and road salt based
on garage location, hauling cost, and availability. Specifics of the award for type of product and
vendor are on file with the Purchasing Department.

< Bid #24-0919 — Puzzley Run Water Treatment Plant Improvements

Two (2) Bid responses were received for this Bid: Ferri Contracting Co., Inc ($167,000.00) and
Beitzel Corporation ($198,160.00).

After reviewing the Bids for compliance with administrative requirements and based on the
feedback from the Garrett County Department of Public Works, the Garrett County Department of

Financial Services — Purchasing Division recommended awarding the Bid to Ferri Contracting Co., Inc.
for $167,000.00.

The Board of County Commissioners, on a motion by Commissioner Savage, which was seconded by

Commissioner Tichnell, and made unanimous by Chairman Edwards, approved all the Bid Awards as
recommended.

7. ANNOUNCEMENTS:

+* The Board of Garrett County Commissioners announced that the next Public Meeting will be
held on Tuesday, October 22, 2024, at 4:00 p.m. at the Garrett County Courthouse.

ADJOURNMENT: The Board of County Commissioners, on a motion by Commissioner Tichnell, which was

seconded by Commissioner Savage, and made unanimous by Chairman Edwards, adjourned the Public Meeting
at 4:30 P.M.

Attest: By Order of the Board,
KEVIN G. NULL PAUL C. EDWARDS, Chairman
County Administrator Board of County Commissioners

Public Meeting October 7, 2024 - Page 3 of 3



RO MEOL SE

THE BOARD OF GARRETT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

203 South Fourth Street - Courthouse - Room 207 Oakland, Maryland 21550
www.garrettcountymd.gov countycommissioners@garrettcountymd.gov

301-334-8970 -+ 301-895-3188 FAX 301-334-5000
Board of Commissioners County Administrator
Paul C. Edwards Kevin G. Null
Ryan S. Savage
S. Larry Tichnell County Attorney

Gorman E. Getty I1I
RESOLUTION 2024 -9

DEEP CREEK WATERSHED ZONING ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS - FARM WINERY

WHEREAS, the Land Use Article of the Maryland Annotated Code empowers the County to prepare, enact, amend,
and provide for the administration and enforcement of a Zoning Ordinance within its territorial limits; and

WHEREAS, the Garrett County Planning Commission, acting with the advice and assistance of the citizens of the
County has caused to be prepared a “Deep Creek Watershed Zoning Ordinance” which The Board of County Commissioners
formally adopted and became effective on June 1, 1997; and

WHEREAS, said Zoning Ordinance may be amended from time to time to ensure that the intended standards are
relevant to the changing physical and economic environment of Garrett County; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Garrett County Commissioners acting with the advice and assistance of the Planning
Commission and citizens of the County has considered certain amendments to the Deep Creek Watershed Zoning Ordinance
as proposed by the Garrett County Planning Commission; and

WHEREAS, said Ordinance amendments have been subject to public review and to public hearings pursuant to the
Land Use Article of the Maryland Annotated Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland does
hereby enact the following text amendments to the Deep Creek Watershed Zoning Ordinance as set forth in Exhibit A of
this Resolution. Said Amendments were duly adopted by a unanimous vote of the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett
County, Maryland this 7t day of October 2024.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Garrett County Planning Commission shall cause said amendments to be filed with
the Clerk of the Circuit Court of Garrett County.

DULY ADOPTED BY A UNANIMOUS VOTE OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSION RRE’U COUNTY MARYLAND THIS 7*" DAY OF OCTOBER

RYAN S. SAVAGE, Commissioner

S. LARRY TM-INELL, Commissioner

| certify that the foregoing resolution was duly passed and adopted by the Board of County Commissioners at a regular
meeting held September 3, 2024; | further certify that this is the original resolution; that | am the County Administrator
for the said County Commissioners charged with the responsibility of keeping and recording all minutes, records and acts
of the said County Commissioners; and | further certify Paul C. Edwards, Ryan S. Savage, and S. Larry Tichnell to be the

appropriate officials to sign the said resolutigg. W

KEVIN G. NULL
County Administrator




L |
i
e
<o
L)
W
e, &
@t_?ﬁ
e
=
LJ:"‘!
oy

Exhibit A

or S

DEEP CREEK WATERSHED ZONING ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS

1. Add a new Definition to read as follows: 157.007.B.(29)B “FARM WINERY — A winery
operation having an approved Maryland Class 3 or 4 winery license and conducted on
property classified as agricultural by the Maryland Department of Assessments and
Taxation. A Farm Winery may conduct wine tastings that include accessory food sales and
have retail sales of wine and winery-related products.”

2. Amend Section 157.024 Table of Use Regulations by adding a new Section 157.024(E)29
“Farm Winery, subject to the following provisions:

a) A maximum of 500 square feet of floor area may be devoted to retail sales of wine
and winery-related products.

b) At least two acres of the ingredients used in the production of beverages must be
grown on- site. The growing area must be established within two years of approval.”

The use shall be permitted by Special Exception in all zoning districts

3. Amend Section 157.041 Table of Dimensional Requirements by adding a new section
“157.041.E.4 Farm Winery (Minimum Yard Widths shall be for any structures used for retail
sales or tastings)”. The Table columns shall be completed as follows: Zoning District:
Anywhere Permitted; Minimum Total Lot or Land Area Per Use: 20 acres; Minimum Average
Lot Area Per Dwelling Unit: Blank; Minimum Lot Width: Blank; Minimum Front Yard Width:
75; Minimum Side Yard Width: 100; Minimum Rear Yard Width: 100.



JBRO0S BEDLOR
THE BOARD OF GARRETT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

203 South Fourth Street - Courthouse - Room 207 Oakland, Maryland 21550
www.garrettcountymd.gov  countycommissioners@garrettcountymd.gov

301-334-8970 -301-895-3188 FAX 301-334-5000
Board of Commissioners County Administrator
Paul C. Edwards Kevin G. Null
Ryan S. Savage
S. Larry Tichnell County Attorney

Gorman E. Getty III

RESOLUTION NO. 2024 - 10

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, A BODY
POLITIC AND CORPORATE AND A POLITICAL SUBDIVISION OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND (THE “COUNTY”),
AUTHORIZING THE SALE OF REAL PROPERTY KNOWN AS LOT NO. 3-A, OF THE KEYSERS RIDGE BUSINESS
PARK, CONSISTING OF 2.0 ACRES, MORE OR LESS, SITUATE IN ELECTION DISTRICT NO. 3, GARRETT
COUNTY, MARYLAND, (THE “PROPERTY”), TO DEEP CREEK MOUNTAIN UTILITIES, LLC, A MARYLAND
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY HAVING A PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS IN GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND
(“DC MOUNTAIN UTILITIES”), FOR THE SUM OF THIRTY THOUSAND DOLLARS AND NO CENTS
($30,000.00) AND AUTHORIZING THE COUNTY TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACT OF SALE AND RIGHT OF
ENTRY AGREEMENT WITH DC MOUNTAIN UTILITIES WITH RESPECT TO THE SALE OF THE REAL PROPERTY.

Explanation

The Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland, a body politic and corporate and a political
subdivision of the State of Maryland (the “County”), desires to sell the real property known and identified as
Lot No. 3-A, of the Keysers Ridge Business Park, consisting of 2.0 acres, more or less, situate in Election District
No. 3, Garrett County, Maryland, as shown on a Plat entitled Preliminary, Final, and Record Plat of Major
Subdivision Prepared for Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland, dated August 2023,
and recorded September 11, 2023, in Plat Case WLB 2, File 32, among the Plat Records of Garrett County,
Maryland, a copy of which Plat is attached hereto, incorporated herein, and marked as Exhibit No. 1 (the
“Property”), to Deep Creek Mountain Utilities, LLC, a Maryland limited liability company having a principal
place of business in Garrett County, Maryland (“DC Mountain Utilities”), for the sum of Thirty Thousand
Dollars and No Cents ($30,000.00) (the “Purchase Price”). The specific terms and conditions of the agreement
between the County and DC Mountain Utilities are set forth in a form Contract of Sale and Right of Entry
Agreement, a copy of which is attached hereto, incorporated herein, and marked as Exhibit No. 2.

In accordance with the provisions of Title 5, Subtitle 3, Sections 5-301 through 5-332, inclusive, of the
Economic Development Article of the Annotated Code of Maryland (the “State Act”), the County has caused
this Resolution to be prepared to reflect the terms and conditions relating to the County’s authorization to
sell the Property to DC Mountain Utilities.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland, as
follows:
1. The Explanation set forth above is incorporated as a substantive provision of this Resolution.

2. The County authorizes the sale of the Property to DC Mountain Utilities for the sum of Thirty Thousand
Dollars and No Cents ($30,000.00).

3. The County authorizes its entry into a Contract of Sale and Right of Entry Agreement with DC Mountain
Utilities (Exhibit 2).



The Chairman of the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland, be and is hereby

authorized to execute any and all documents as may be necessary or required in conjunction with the
sale of the Property.

5. This Resolution shall be effective upon its adoption.

ADOPTED this 7t day of October 2024, by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland,
by its Chairman, Paul C. Edwards, and attested by Kevin G. Null, County Administrator.

ATTEST: THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND

By ""’/ (SEAL)

KEVIN G. NULL BAUL C. EDWARDS
County Administrator Chairman




Pk e
2 /100" Bupeoubue—puUDBLr MR / /-4y :0YRTIM
2 puDiion PUDPOO. L 0r oineso,
E ﬁ%@eﬁ. 9Ty %—Mﬂ«%l,ﬁn e
12 NI "ONIAZAUNS N
» % ONNIINIONI mll« S
% ANYIHOIH T
b/
‘9oUBpPiAS JOLRANS puUD MBU JO AIBA0DSID
uodn abuoud 0} 102Igns 21D SUOND2O| PIDS 4BHRG pus 3bpamouy Aw jo 3S9Q
5Y) 0} 1994400 240 PuD AUNOS PIDS JO SPIODSS PUD] U} Yum uonounfuod up AsAIns
P9y 03 BuipioooD sjuiod PSIDINOIDD 2J0 @ ISNY) PAYDW SIUI0D Auadosd jouy puo
yas sysom uym poubow o 198 doo yim Uogas Z/L uedq SADY @ ISNY) PaxJDW W
519ui00 Ayedasd joY) PuUD PUND UIBQ BADY O ISAY] PAMIDLU SISUIOD Ayiadosd ayy ﬁ
jouy Ajueo Agesay | ‘pekemuns Ausdosd ayy 01 opn Ay Ul pajsassul sanuod o o)
JIVOIILYID S.HOAIANNS w GNYIRSVIN ‘AINNOD LISNYVO 40 SHINOISSIANOD AINNOO 40 GUV08
£20Z 1SNONV :31¥0 OF = .1 308 S —mrErEs RS
« . . T FET ) - .
ANVIAYYA ALNNOD  LI3¥YVO € 'ON 1DI41SIG NOLLO3T3 M x/exl e P e
¢ p S 7 SNACHAY THAIOININ
ANVIAYVN ‘ALNNOD LLIYIVD 40 g A N3 TIV ONBOR ALY (TIBYONIAdY S¥) ONIGHOSIH HOd AVId
8 0MOO3Y ¥ 35040 TUM 3M IVHL ONV SNVId ONUNYANOOOY 3HL 3SHOONI
SHANOISSINNOD ALNNOD Jd0 QuvVod 3 o T T T R 2 S
¥O4 Q3UVdI¥d NOISINAENS dOrvin 40 IVid SIHL 40 mﬁ% W_mwoh«. 3HL 3MY IVHL zSéo%&owaws ‘J sm_muw.&m
* . QI3ZINOI ALNOTVHE A3
Q¥003¥ ONY "TYNLJ "AMYNINM3¥d ‘SNYId ONUNYANODOV 3HL ONIAIOANI ONY1 3HL 30 SNINMO 3HL ‘IM
e TTRIVIS ST
o143 08 oy o}
¥OLUING HUNWIH WINIANOHANS ALNNOO LIIVO
PN oY
mﬁwmw v\«\»\w?}
A
*107 TIDHINNOD INO ¥OJ WILSAS TWSOdSIA JOVM3S OEnd ONY / hat \
KddNS ¥IIVM OMBNG 304 SNOUYINO3Y NOISICBNS INIANOMIAN 3HL 40 s / Y /
GNVIRVA OL 00 ¥04 GPROIHO N338 SYH ¥—€ 107 e % . "\
IVAONddY ININLIAVAIA HITVIH Ve P ¥ e T T T e N \
ALNNOD LLINUVO Z L e . N \
SHOM ONBNd 40 INININGID DD Ve P s AN 5
ETO) S3HO NOISING ‘HLIINO NOGNYAE Z - -~ 6£2/200} \ \ /
f o 27 4 4 ONVUVA 'AINNOO LIZHNVD 50 \ \
/ 7/ SUINOISSINMOD ALNNOD ALNNOD 40 Guvog A 4
HASAS KTddNS HIUYM e / \ !
3901 SHISAIN IHL OGNV ALNOVA INBMLYINL NILYMILLSVA 3000 SISAIN -, ; b \
- IHL AB 30IAMIS 04 GIAGNIY S| NYId SHL NO NMOHS v—£ 107 3HL - p e | \
SN ONENd 40 ININLYVEIO - / T N \ \
= AINNOD L134¥VD e S - R
[aa] e R L s TG0Y M BEAESE S : {
T _ ‘ “ - ! ! !
7 e i | i
52 R\&‘m , . : P :
i - V- j / |
G314300¥ ONY NOISSINOD ONINNYJ \\ v | I i /
/ / {
7 / / 4 i .
, / 642/£001 K / / ©s@
S 7 ANVTAMYA “ALNNOD LI3N¥VO 30 / / } ®C
/ SHINOISSINNOD ALNNOD 40 Q¥vOE / 7 f =1
/ g 30 1¥vd K ! fE
/ S SIUOY 00°Z Ve A onaing ! wa g/
/ it v-¢ 107 / Ghael I 257
‘INISINS X0E U SIJOTS TVENIVN ON 6 m s «Ox \ ; R au ¥ / )
0GGLT GNVLRIVI "ONVINYO ] o &) / ! uﬂ \ S w 1
£0Z WOOY — 133AIS HINNO3 HINOS £0Z i o) / ) * gl it eng _
SHINOISSINOD AINNOO LI3HAYO 40 G¥V08 A3J0TINIT '8 | 18 % / / 2 //, | WWM e
) “| - SI07 40 N3ENON 642/L004 _s,, s f f _ ! =il N
SIYMY 000T — IVROY WIOL L ONYAMYA ‘AINNOO LI3MYD 40 7 ‘ ! [ .x./un, [N
. SHINOISSINNOO AINNOD ALNNOD 40 GHYO 3 p / | \ 2 - d
1334 S¢ G3¥INOIY HIOW 101 WINININ 1 \ , / / R /,.. Vi 3 \
*3S 000°04 Q3WNOIY VHY 107 WNRINA 9 \ \ P Y, J _. 4 LU LSRN i A\
¥IUNID ININCTINT ~03 ~NOUYIISSYID ONVI G N \ 7 / / =] / 3 \
‘BYL TI0MVG L dYN XYL 40 Luvd ¥ \ [ e ' / \ 3sesizas ; a! N
iy NIVId 0003 \ | T / / \ L
AONZOY INIPGOVNYA ADNIOUIIG V303 ANY A\ S £y 7 rees 3 SryE9E N \ullln.\ll.lll.y‘ll VA
NO NMOHS SY NIVid 00O HYA 001 JLIYNOISIO . \ SN N T BT D i A \
ANY NIHLM S311 AL¥3dO¥d SHL 40 1d¥d ON ¢ \ \ 7 N o= e e e / /)
N ; \ o o — / ;
‘SIONIOV UVINAONAAY NO¥3 NOLONYISEO N ~ - ; k 7
ONY NOLLONNISNOO AYMNIIVM ONY SNIVId N | / : , A
Q004 'SONVLIM OL GAIVIY SINN3d ININUNI N : ; ZHL TNV L IV VL } | uDN . N
TIV OIS OL AUKEISNOISIY SHINMO 3HL St Il 2 \ / N L otk Ainnoo Lo so [ / | oo ¥38u - .
‘NNOHS SWHIHLO SSTIN ANYONNOS NOISWENS \ ) L0 N BEROSSRGS AIKIOO ANOG A0 EHoeH 4 ! \
3HL 40 1334 00} NIMLM SY34Y ¥SOdSId 3OVMIS . \ / s A / \ \ 4 N
¥0 STIIM 3S0d0Hd 3O ONUSIX3 ON 3u¥ 3u3HL 'V \ \ / e s / o \ 4 1
. / L gpmzy - \ J B : \ i
\ N e ¥ ® \ \ !
.|Mnm||u._m. 7 8 3SV0 [N ,fr\:f\\ / RN A \
I¥id NKZ 40 AvQ NPt = s 25 ! \
3HL 0314 m<m »ﬁ ML ONI ‘ONIGANNS . : \
® ONRIANIONI ONVIHOIH 40 1SANDIY 3HL 1V




BRO0S BEO50 |

EXHIBIT 2

CONTRACT OF SALE AND RIGHT OF ENTRY AGREEMENT

THIS CONTACT OF SALE AND RIGHT OF ENTRY AGREEMENT (this
“Agreement”), made this day of , 2024, by and between the
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, a body
politic and corporate and a political subdivision of the State of Maryland (the “Seller”), and DEEP
CREEK MOUNTAIN UTILITIES, LLC, a Maryland limited liability company, having a principal
place of business in Garrett County, Maryland (the “Buyer”).

Explanation

Seller owns certain real property known and identified as Lot No. 3-A, of the Keysers
Ridge Business Park, consisting of 2.0 acres, more or less, situate in Election District No. 3, Garrett
County, Maryland, as shown on a Plat entitled Preliminary, Final, and Record Plat of Major Subdivision
Prepared for Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland, dated August 2023, and
recorded September 11, 2023, in Plat Case WLB 2, File 32, among the Plat Records of Garrett County,
Maryland (the “Property”), a copy of which plat is attached hereto, incorporated herein, and marked
as Exhibit A. Buyer wishes to buy, and Seller wishes to sell, the Property, subject to the terms of
this Agreement. In addition, Buyer and Seller wish to provide Buyer with access to the Property
prior to closing. The partics enter into this Agreement for the purpose of memorializing the terms

and conditions of their agreements.

NOW, THEREFORE, WITNESSETH, that for and in consideration of the agreements

hereinafter set forth, Seller and Buyer agree as follows:

1. Explanation. The Explanation set forth above is hereby incorporated as a

substantive provision of this Agreement.

2. Property to be Sold. Seller agrees to sell and convey, and Buyer agrees to purchase,
the Property.

3. Liens and Encumbrances. Seller shall convey the Property free and clear of all liens

and encumbrances.



JHRO0S ®R0O0Z

4. Purchase Price. The purchase price of the Property is THIRTY THOUSAND
DOLLARS AND NO CENTS ($30,000.00) (the “Purchase Price”).

5. Payment of Purchase Price. The Purchase Price of the Property shall be paid in full

by Buyer to Seller at closing.

6. Commencement of Construction and Right of Repurchase. Buyer shall commence

site preparation and construction of the improvements on the Property within one (1) year of the
date of closing. In the event Buyer fails to commence site preparation and construction of the
improvements within one (1) year, then and in that event Buyer grants to Seller the right to
repurchase the Property at the original Purchase Price, to be exercised by Seller in its sole
discretion. Repurchase of the Property by Seller in exercise of its rights under the terms of this
provision shall be effected by the execution of a deed from Buyer to Seller and cancellation by

Seller of the Deed of Trust Note.

7. Covenants and Restrictions. Buyer acknowledges and agrees that the Property is,

and will be conveyed, subject to a Declaration of Covenants, Conditions, and Restrictions for the
Keysers Ridge Business Park dated May 10, 2013, and recorded May 23, 2013, in Liber No. 1738
at Page 0497, and a Supplemental Declaration of Covenants, Conditions, and Restrictions for the
Keysers Ridge Business Park dated April 19,2016, and recorded April 20, 2016, in Liber No. 1931
at Page 0027, both of which documents are recorded among the Land Records of Garrett County,
Maryland.

8. Transfer Costs. Taxes, and Assessments. Buyer and Seller shall each be responsible

for payment of one-half (1/2) of the recordation taxes and state and local transfer taxes relating to
the conveyance of the Property to Buyer. State and county real estate taxes and similar public
charges against the Property that are payable on an annual basis shall be prorated between Buyer
and Seller as of the date of closing and assumed and paid thereafier by Buyer. Seller shall be
responsible for the preparation of the deed of conveyance and documents of transfer. Buyer shall
be responsible for the cost of examination of title, preparation of any mortgage or lien documents,

and for recording fees associated with those documents.



JEROO9 BEQ503

9. Closing. Closing shall be on the day of , 2024, or on

such earlier date as may be agreed between Buyer and Seller (the “Closing Date). At closing, Seller

shall deliver a fully executed and acknowledged deed conveying the Property to Buyer.

10. Right of Entry. Upon the execution of this Agreement, Buyer, and its

representatives and agents, shall have reasonable access to the Property and the right to conduct,

at Buyer’s sole cost and expense, reasonable inspections, and investigations of the Property.

11.  Construction of Improvements Prior to Closing. Buyer may, at any time or times

before closing, enter upon the Property for the purpose of commencing construction of
improvements and associated activities on the Property. Entry onto the Property by Buyer prior to
closing shall be at Buyer’s sole risk and expense. If Buyer exercises its rights under this paragraph,
Buyer agrees to restore the Property to its prior condition to the extent of any changes made by its
agents or representatives in the event closing does not take place. Buyer agrees to indemnify, hold
harmless, and defend Seller from and against any and all claims, demands, actions, or causes of
action arising out of or related to Buyer’s use and occupancy of the Property prior to closing,
including any claims arising out of the construction of improvements on the Property. Buyer shall
be solely responsible for and shall pay, when and as due, all costs associated with Buyer’s
improvement to the Property. In the event Buyer makes improvements to the Property prior to
closing, Buyer shall notify all third parties that any work performed relating to the Property shall

not entitle the person performing such work to any mechanic’s lien, or other lien, on the Property.

12.  Valid Agreement. This Agreement has been duly authorized and executed by Seller
and Buyer and constitutes a valid and binding agreement, enforceable in accordance with its terms,
and neither the execution and delivery of this Agreement, nor the consummation of the transactions
contemplated herein, will constitute a violation or breach by Buyer of any provision of any
agreement or other instrument to which it is a party, or to which it may be subject although not a
party, or will result in or constitute a violation or breach of any judgment, order, writ, injunction,

or decree issued against it.

13. Binding Agreement. This Agreement shall be binding upon, and inure to, the

benefit of the heirs, executors, administrators, successors, and assigns of the respective parties.



JEROO S BEQSTY

14. Governance and Interpretation. This Agreement shall be governed by and

interpreted in accordance with the lawszof the State of Maryland.

15.  Entire Agreement. This Agreement contains the entire agreement of the parties and
there are no other representations or agreements between the parties, whether oral or written. This

Agreement may not be modified or terminated, except by an instrument, in writing, signed by both

Seller and Buyer.

16.  Notice. Any notice required under the terms of this Agreement may be delivered
personally or by mail addressed to the parties at their respective addresses as set forth on Exhibit
B, attached hereto and made a part hereof, postage-prepaid, certified with a return receipt

requested.

WITNESS the execution of this Agreement by the authorized representatives of each of

the respective parties the day and year first above written.

BUYER:
ATTEST: DEEP CREEK MOUNTAIN UTILITIES, LLC
By (SEAL)
Steven R. Stuck,
Managing Member
SELLER:
ATTEST: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND

By (SEAL)
Kevin G. Null, Paul C. Edwards,
County Administrator Chairman




AY LE NG

undn obuByd o 128/QA8 asp suClROBC B

138 sBusOm upe jpoubow Jo 138 dod uum 1oaes L2/1 ® SNU DOMICW
sipuina Aadosd 10U PUD PUNOY uFRG PADY O BN} PIMDU S1AW0D Apadosd Bul
30U Aes AaRssuy ipadaains Aupdosd Ayl oy Apn By U pE:isauaiu seuod §o Of
YDA HAD SHOLAENS

€202 LSNONY 3iv0

OF = .1 3v0s
INYIASYA AINNOD LL3¥NVD * ¢

‘ON LORILSI NOIULO3M3

ANVIAYVA ‘ALNNOD LIIYYVO 40
SYINOISSINNOD ALNNOD 40 Q¥vod

YOI Q3Uvd3Ud NOISIAIGENS MOMYR 40 LVd
a¥003Y ONY NIz

‘AYYNINM3ND

azi "o ov [

HOLORIG HIWEH TYUNGRNOEANG ALNI0O LISNWYS

M“\\

A0 WONIMN0D INC ¥04 WELSAS WSOJSIO 3OWMIS Drand ONY s
ANZMOIGIG ONVLRIVI 0L JONYHNOINOD 04 O3X03HO AGE8 SW v-¢ 107

IVAOQNAIY INIWINVHIA HLITV3IH
AINNOD LLINAVO

05
\
\

SXUOM ONBNe 40 LARLINVGXD 0’9 7
A HOSAD WALEAOR) NOONOSS

9

v
ERiLCH

el
R

AWAUSAS AddNS YIUvA
9004 SHISAIN ML ONY AUUDYS ANGRUVENL MIUVMILSYM FO0N SNISLIN
gﬁ%%&%&xﬂ!«ﬁﬂééiﬁ(‘hkﬁuﬁ

m\—ﬂkn. SILAILN 2118Nd 4O ININL¥VIIO
f— AINNQD LI3N¥VO
,‘,m L
P
ANGSHUS XKOU MO SIS HUW ON 8
05512 ONVUNMT "ONYDIVO
207 WOOB ~ L3S HINNO HIKS £07
SOBNOSSIMNOD AINNOS LITWYD 30 OHYDE RBMOTIMIC ¢ §
Lo~ SI07 40 ¥IGAN BLL/LOOH

TSRON 0007 - FNIEW WI0L L

UF34 B4 WHIN0EY HIOM 107 MONININ
45 00001 GIWNOI YIUY 10T MOMNK 9

YANID INFOIGNG ~DF ~NOUYOLISSYID UMY ¢

ONY UMY UNNDD L300 40
SHINGISSINAOD AINGOD AINNOD 40 (RIVOS

O TIONV ‘L AW XYL 3O 1NV Y

TV RIS 0L AUNBISNOGSIY SHENMO HL ST 1 2T

NMOHS ISIRGGHIO SSTINA ANVONNOS NOISINIBNS

ML 40 1335 001 NIMUM SY38Y WSOJSIO 30WM3S

YO STIEM Q3IS0dONd ¥0 DRUSIXT ON 38 ROHL 't N

SAON

™ 5%, 3050 £

Al p
3L [V g Brge gL
¥ ONIINIONI ONYIHOIH H0 1S3N03Y 3KL 1v

KiddfiS MWK DIBNG 404 SNOUYTNOSS NOSIAOENS INGNNONAN 3HL 50 4 Ve

,_—‘\
A
AN

N
'
k/

P

842 30vd '£001 W38N

ONYTAMYR AINNOD LITHIVD 30 SWINGISSINNGD AINNOD 40 GUVOE
e “Sopeas 3 v

INIWILVIS SH3INMO

642/4001
ANVIAMVA ‘ALNNOD LLINNVO 30

tg—— -
~.

s t—
..'-!(t.l-l..t:lvl!l‘ll

105 IV ‘L AV VL
o X OV UNN0D LBENYS 50 H
\,. qﬁzggtxﬁbgﬂ

’

L

] S¥INOISSINNOO ALNNOD 3O CHVOR 2 ; 1 e
g m%o o ’ o] mmmr.
.- AOV 002 ) 5
*m V-5 101 K aemssoa W..MZ
SwE
o © ; w3 BLﬂ
g ") ’ s SwE
A : 8101233
_w / ’ . /f | &38
| ! RN |
; 8
/s | al o
/ zvor = AN
i | semzes g
. =
- \,; ~ o zzees 3 .eewEIE N l.....!\l\lc.lL.»t —

RIVE
OW,
389

!
|

\ | a0 WIE

y
L=
%
®
QO
\




JERGOS w8500

EXHIBIT B
Notice to Buyer shall be mailed to : Deep Creck Mountain Utilities, LLC
- Steven R. Stuck, Managing Member
25227 Garrett Highway

McHenry, Maryland 21541

Notice to Seller shall be mailed to : The Board of County Commissioners

of Garrett County, Maryland

~ Attention: Kim E. Durst

- Manager of Business Development
Department of Business Development
Frederick A. Thayer, III Courthouse
203 South Fourth Street, Room 208
Oakland, Maryland 21550

With a copy to : Gorman E. Getty, III, Esquire
Getty Law Offices, P.A.
Post Office Box 1485
23 Washington Street
Cumberland, Maryland 21501-1485



meEn 0 DR D
BRQOC BEGS0T

THE BOARD OF GARRETT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
203 South Fourth Street - Courthouse - Room 207 Oakland, Maryland 21550
www.garrettcountymd.gov  countycommissioners@garrettcountymd.gov

301-334-8970 - 301-895-3188 FAX 301-334-5000
Board of Commissioners County Administrator
Paul C. Edwards Kevin G. Null
Ryan S. Savage
S. Larry Tichnell County Attorney

Gorman E. Getty III

RESOLUTION NO. 2024 -11

THE RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF
GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, REPEALING, REVOKING, AND
CANCELING THE DECLARATION OF COVENANTS, CONDITIONS, AND
RESTRICTIONS FOR THE KEYSER’S RIDGE BUSINESS PARK DATED
MAY 10,2013, AND RECORDED MAY 13,2013, IN LIBER NO. 1738 AT PAGE
0497, (THE “ORIGINAL DECALARTION”) AND THE SUPPLEMENTAL
DECLARATION OF COVENANTS, CONDITIONS, AND RESTRICTIONS
FOR THE KEYSER’S RIDGE BUSINESS PARK DATED APRIL 19,2016, AND
RECORDED APRIL 20, 2016, IN LIBER NO. 1931 AT PAGE 0027, (THE
“SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION”), BOTH RECORDED AMONG THE
LAND RECORDS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND; AND ADOPTING
AND RESTATING THE COVENANTS, CONDTIONS, AND RESTRICTIONS
FOR THE KEYSERS RIDGE BUSINESS PARK IN A NEW DOCUMENT
ENTITLED THE “RESTATED DECLARATION OF COVENANTS,
CONDITIONS, AND RESTRICTIONS FOR THE KEYSERS RIDGE
BUSINESS PARK,” WHICH SHALL BE RECORDED AMONG THE LAND
RECORDS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND (THE “NEW
DECLARATION”). A COPY OF THE NEW DECLARATION IS ATTACHED
HERETO, INCORPORATED HEREIN, AND MARKED AS EXHIBIT 1.

EXPLANATION

THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, a
body politic and corporate, and a political subdivision of the State of Maryland (the “County”), passed and
adopted the Original Declaration for the Keyser’s Ridge Business Park (the “Park”) and the Supplemental
Declaration imposing certain restrictions on the development of the property which comprises the Park (the
“Covenants”).

The County has determined that certain Covenants may unintentionally impair the marketability of
property that comprises the Park (the “Property™), and that repealing, revoking, and canceling the Original
Declaration and the Supplemental Declaration, and adopting the New Declaration would be in keeping with the
general purpose and common scheme for development of the Park. At the time of this Resolution, the County
is the sole owner of the Property that comprises the Park.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County,
Maryland, as follows:

1. That the Explanation set forth above is incorporated as a substantive portion of this Resolution;
and



That the Board of County Commissioners hereby repeals, revokes, and cancels the Original
Declaration and the Supplemental Declaration in their entirety; and

That the Board of County Commissioners Hef’eby adopts the New Declaration as and for the
covenants, conditions, and restrictions that apply to the Property and the Park and that the New

Declaration shall be deemed to be covenants that run with the land that comprises the Property
and the Park.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Resolution shall become effective immediately upon its

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 7* day of OCTOBER, 2024.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND

/// (SEAL)

KEVIN G. NULL PAUL C. EDWARDS
County Administrator Chairman



EXHIBIT 1 TO RESOLUTION NO. 2024-11

RESTATED DECLARATION OF
COVENANTS, CONDITIONS, AND RESTRICTIONS
FOR THE KEYSERS RIDGE BUSINESS PARK

THIS RESTATED DECLARATION of Covenants, Conditions, and Restrictions for the
Keysers Ridge Business Park (the "Declaration") is made this day of
, 2024, by the BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF
GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, a body politic and corporate and a political subdivision of
the State of Maryland (the "Declarant” or the “County”), whose address is 203 South Fourth Street,
Room 207, Oakland, Maryland 21550.

EXPLAINATION

Declarant owns property in Election District No. 3, Garrett County, Maryland, more
particularly described in the following deeds: (1) a deed from the Maryland Economic
Development Corporation to the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland,
dated April 24, 2013, and recorded May 1, 2013, in Liber No. 1736 at Page 0088, among the Land
Records of Garrett County, Maryland (the “Land Records™); (2) a deed from the American
Woodmark Corporation to The Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland,
dated April 4, 2016, and recorded May 13, 2016, in Liber No. 1930 at Page 0056, among the Land
Records; and (3) a deed from the State of Maryland, to the use of the Department of Natural
Resources, to the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland, dated October
10,2003, and recorded October 28, 2003, in Liber No. 1007 at Page 0279, among the Land Records
(the “Property”) The Property is designed as the Keysers Ridge Business Park (the “Park™).

Declarant previously executed a Declaration of Covenants, Conditions, and Restrictions
for the Park dated May 10, 2013, and recorded May 13, 2013, in Liber No. 1738 at Page 0497,
among the Land Records (the “Original Declaration”) and a Supplemental Declaration of
Covenants, Conditions, and Restrictions for the Keyser’s Ridge Business Park dated April 19,
2016, and recorded April 20, 2016, in Liber No. 1931 at Page 0027, among the Land Records (the
“Supplemental Declaration”). The Original Declaration and the Supplemental Declaration are
collectively the “Original Documents.” On October 7, 2024, the County repealed the Original
Documents and adopted this Declaration.

NOW, THEREFORE, Declarant declares that the Property shall be held, transferred, sold,
conveyed, and occupied subject to the conditions, covenants, restrictions, and reservations set forth
in Exhibit A to this Declaration (the “Covenants™) together with easements of record, shall run
with the land and be binding upon all parties having any right, title, or interest in the Property,
their heirs, successors, and assigns, and shall inure to the benefit of each owner thereof.

DECLARANT further declares that all current and subsequent owners and developers,
and/or their heirs, successors, and assigns, agree that they will provide any and all services without
discrimination to all persons without regard to their age, race, religion, color, sex, handicap, or
national origin.



EXHIBIT 1 TO RESOLUTION NO. 2024-11

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Declarant has caused this declaration to be signed and executed
the day and year first above written.

ATTEST: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND

By (SEAL)
KEVIN G. NULL, PAUL C. EDWARDS,
County Administrator Chairman
STATE OF MARYLAND,
COUNTY OF GARRETT, TO-WIT:
I HEREBY CERTIFY, that on this day of OCTOBER, 2024, before me, the

undersigned officer, a Notary Public in and for the aforesaid State and County, personally appeared
PAUL C. EDWARDS, known to me, or satisfactorily proven to be, the Chairman of the BOARD
OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, a body politic and
corporate and a political subdivision of the State of Maryland, and that he, as such Chairman, being
authorized so to do, executed the foregoing instrument for the purposes therein contained by
signing, in my presence, the name of the corporation by himself as Chairman.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I hereunto set my hand and official seal.

Notary Public

My Commission Expires:

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the within instrument was prepared by, or under the supervision
of, the undersigned, an attorney duly admitted to practice before the Court of Appeals of Maryland.

GORMAN E. GETTY, III



ux:;:\ 0 Ni q F‘%gli} g 1 {
EXHIBIT 1 TO RESOLUTION NO. 2024-11

EXHIBIT A- -

RESTATED DECLARATION OF
COVENANTS, CONDITIONS, AND RESTRICTIONS
FOR THE KEYSERS RIDGE BUSINESS PARK (the “RESTATED
DECLARATION”)

Section I — Property Subject to this Declaration

These Covenants apply to the Property and the Park. They are effective upon passage of a
Resolution by the County adopting this Restated Declaration (the “County’s Resolution” and upon
recordation of the County’s Resolution and this Restated Declaration among the Land Records.

All Property sold by Declarant will be subject to such other conditions and restrictions as
are agreed to by the parties, including, but not limited to, specific usage plans, construction plans,
and implementation timetables. Such additional conditions will be incorporated in any option or
sales contract related to such land with such provisions intended to survive the delivery of a deed
of conveyance. These Covenants do not, in any way, release the Owner or Tenant of any Building
Site located on the Property from the provisions of any local, state, or federal rules, regulations,
statues, or ordinances and codes which may be applicable to the Property or any improvements to
the Property.

Section II — Definition of Terms
All terms not otherwise defined shall be as defined by the County’s Resolution.
“Building Site” shall mean any piece, parcel, or plot of land lying within the limits of the
Park, which is occupied or designed to be occupied by an individual, business, or technology
building or buildings and accessory structures, or by such other buildings or uses which are in
conformance with the requirements of these Covenants, together with open spaces arranged,
designed, and improved to be used in connection with such buildings or uses.

“Park” shall mean the Keysers Ridge Business Park.

“Covenants” shall mean the restated covenants, conditions, and restrictions set forth in this
Restated Declaration.

“Declarant” shall mean the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland.
“Improvements” shall mean and include any building or buildings, out-buildings
appurtenant thereto, parking areas, loading areas, signs, fences, walls, hedges, lawns and plantings,

and any structures of any type or kind located above the ground.

“Owner” shall mean any private entity owning a Building Site within the Park.



R00Q BRrBO i 2
EXHIBIT 1 TO RESOLUTION NO. 2024-11

“Propane Distribution System” shall mean the captive propane distribution system located
within the Park and owned by Deep Creek Mountain Utilities, LLC, its successors and assigns.

“Tenant” shall mean any tenants of an Owner of a Building Site located in the Park.
Section III — General Purpose of Covenants

The Property is subject to the terms of this Restated Declaration and the Covenants set
forth herein to insure proper use and appropriate development and improvement of each Building
Site located on or within the Park in order to protect the Owners of each and all of the Building
Sites against improper use of surrounding Building Sites as will depreciate the value of their
property; to guard against the erection thereof of structures built of improper or unsuitable
materials; to insure adequate and reasonable development of said Building Sites; to encourage the
erection of attractive improvements thereon, with appropriate locations thereof on Building Sites;
to prevent haphazard and inharmonious Improvements of Building Sites; to secure and maintain
proper setbacks from streets, adequate free spaces between structures, and for the landscaping,
planting, and maintenance of said open spaces; to provide adequately for off-street parking and for
loading and storage of vehicles; to control, through performance standards, the undesirable aspects
of industrial operations; and in general, to provide for superior development of said Building Sites;
and to insure that the use of Building Sites shall not adversely affect the interest of Declarant for
Owners of Building Sites in the Park, nor the health and safety of employees or workers thereon,
and will not be detrimental to the use or development of adjacent property of the general
neighborhood.

Section IV -General Provisions

1. To Run With Land: Except as otherwise set forth herein, the Covenants herein set
forth shall run with the land and shall bind the Owner, its successors and assigns, and all parties
claiming by, through, or under them shall be taken to hold, agree, and covenant with the Owner,
its successors and assigns, and with each of them to conform to and observe such restrictions as to
the use of Building Sites and the construction of Improvements thereon.

2. Life: Each of the Covenants set forth herein shall continue and be binding upon the
Owners of all Building Sites, their successors and assigns, and upon each of them and all parties
and all persons claiming under them for a period of fifty (50) years from the aforementioned
Effective Date.

3. Separability: Invalidation of any of these Covenants or any part thereof by
judgment or court orders shall in no way affect any of the other provisions, which shall remain in
full force and effect.

Section V — Enforcement

Violation or breach of any Covenant herein contained shall give to Declarant and every
Owner or Tenant of a Building Site, subject to these Covenants, the right to seek such remedies at



009 3505 )
O RE

df;ﬁ TION NO. 2024-11

1|~
JEr
it
1

’i
EXHIBIT 1 T

law or in equity by proceeding at law or in equity against the person, persons, firms, or corporations
who have violated or are attempting to violate any of these Covenants to enjoin or prevent them
from doing so, to cause said violation to be remedied or to recover damages for said violation.

The result of every action or omission whereby any Covenant herein contained is violated,
in whole or in part, is hereby declared to be and to constitute a nuisance, and every remedy allowed
by law or equity against an Owner or Tenant, either public or private, shall be applicable against
every such result and may be exercised by Declarant or by any Owner or Building Site subject to
these restrictions.

In any legal or equitable proceeding for the enforcement or to restrain the violation of these
Covenants or any provision hereof, the losing party or parties shall pay the attorney’s fees of the
prevailing party or parties, in such amount as may be fixed by the court in such proceedings. All
remedies provided herein or at law or in equity shall be cumulative and not exclusive.

Section VI — General Development Standards

1. Permitted Land Uses: Only businesses engaged in light manufacturing, distribution,
professional, technical, and energy production services, or such other services as are authorized by
the County, in its sole discretion, are permitted to operate within the Park. Approval by the County
shall be presumed in the initial sale of a Building Site by the County.

2. Improvement Schedule: An Owner shall obtain a building permit and construct an
Improvement upon the Building Site within eighteen (18) months of the initial transfer of a
Building Site by Declarant. If Owner fails to obtain a building permit and to construct an
Improvement on the Building Site within eighteen (18) moths of the initial transfer of a Building
Site by Declarant, Declarant has the option to repurchase said Building Site at Owner's original
purchase price. If Declarant elects to repurchase the Building Site, it may do so at any time within
the 24-month period following the expiration of the eighteen (18) months following the date of the
initial transfer of the Building Site.

3. Off-Street Parking and Loading: No parking of any vehicle shall be permitted upon
any street or roadway within the Park.

4, Outside Storage: All outside storage of materials, in raw, in process, or finished
state, and all outside waste and rubbish storage facilities, will be provided with adequate screening
as determined by Declarant, in its sole discretion.

5. Landscaping: All open portions of any lot improved for parking, loading,
driveways, and/or walkways shall be adequately drained or graded, shall be suitably landscaped
with trees, shrubs, or planted ground cover or such other suitable means, and shall be maintained
in a neat and attractive condition at all times thereafter. Based upon an approved plan, landscaping
shall be completed within one (1) year after substantial completion or occupancy of the
Improvements to the Building Site.



009 BiE0S L
EXHIBIT 1 TO RESOLUTION NO. 2024-11

6. Utilities: Declarant and/or its designee reserves the right to have constructed,
without expense to an Owner, utility linés, pipes, and conduits underground through an area of
sufficient width across the real estate covered by these Covenants, and each Owner or Tenant shall
execute any all instruments necessary and reasonable for further development of the Park,
including the granting of easements for gas lines, sanitary sewers, storm sewers, communication
lines, entrance and access roads, and electrical lines, provided Owner shall have the right to
designate the location of the easements contemplated by this covenant.

7. No Offensive Uses: No noxious, illegal, hazardous, dangerous, or offensive trade,
services, or activities shall be conducted on any Building Site, nor shall anything be done thereon
which may be or become an annoyance or nuisance to the Owners, Tenants, or guests of other
Building Sites within the Park by reason of unsightliness or the excessive emission of fumes, odors,
glare, heat, vibration, gases, vapors, chemicals, radiation, dust, liquid waste, smoke, or noise.

8. Propane System: The provision of utility service within the Park shall remain
subject to the control and direction of Declarant, provided, however, that Deep Creek Mountain
Utilities, LLC (“Deep Creek Utilities™) shall be the only propane distribution facility to be located
within the Park. The Deep Creek Utilities’ propane distribution facilities shall be deemed a captive
system and has been or will be constructed by Deep Creek Utilities with the assistance of the
County in order to provide gas facilities to each Building Site. All Owners and Tenants of Building
Sites within the Park are required to utilize Deep Creek Utilities for all gas services in the Park or
on a Building Site. Owners and Tenants of Building Sites within the Park are not permitted to have
individual propane tanks on their Building Sites.

Section VII — Procedures for Declarant Review and Approval

1. No building, fence, wall, sign, advertising devise, roadway, loading facility, outside
storage facility, parking area, site grading, planting, landscaping, facility for industrial waste or
sewage disposal, or any other improvement shall be commenced, erected, or constructed, nor shall
any change in the use of any premises be made, until the plans and specifications therefore,
showing the nature, kind, shape, heights, materials, color scheme, lighting, and location on the lot
of the proposed Improvements, grading, landscaping, or alterations and the proposed use or change
in the use of the premises shall have been submitted to and approved in writing by Declarant and
a copy of such plans and specifications as finally approved lodged permanently with Declarant.
Declarant shall have the right to refuse to approve any such plans or specifications or proposed use
of the premises for any reason which Declarant, in its sole discretion, may deem in the best interests
of the Park and the Owners or Tenants or prospective Owners or Tenants of other Building Sites
therein. No change in grade, elevation, or size of land shall be made without written approval from
Declarant.

2. Declarant shall not arbitrarily or unreasonably withhold its approval of such plans
and specifications. If Declarant fails to approve or disapprove such plans and specifications within
thirty (30) days after the same has been formally submitted to it, without Declarant having given
notice of the reason for its inability to so act, it shall be conclusively presumed that Declarant has
approved said plans and specifications, subject, however, to the Covenants contained herein.



BR009 MKOS 15

THE BOARD OF GARRETT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

203 South Fourth Street - Courthouse - Room 207, Oakland, Maryland 21550
WWW.garrettcounty,org.® countycommissioners@garrettcounty.org

301-334-8970 301-895-3188 FAX 301-334-5000
Board of Commissioners County Administrator
Paul C. Edwards Kevin G. Null
Ryan §. Savage County Attorney

S. Larry Tichnell Gorman E. Getty I1I

RESOLUTION NO. 2024 — 12

GARRETT COUNTY PROCUREMENT )
BIDS AND CONTRACTS ORDINANCE

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF
GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, A BODY POLITIC AND CORPORATE AND
GOVERNING BODY OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND (“GARRETT
COUNTY”), INCORPORATING A REVISED GARRETT COUNTY
PROCUREMENT - BIDS AND CONTRACTS ORDINANCE.

Explanation

Increasing the minimum dollar amount of contracts for which the County Commissioners, or any employee of
Garrett County, are required to advertise for bids; exempting certain contracts for professional services from a
requirement to advertise for bids; authorizing certain contracts to be solicited by written bids; and generally
relating to procurement in Garrett County.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, By Garrett County as follows:
L. The Explanation set forth above is incorporated as a substantive provision of this Resolution.

2. Effective upon passage of this Resolution, Garrett County incorporates the Garrett County
Procurement - Bids and Contracts Ordinance, a copy of which is attached hereto and made a part
of this Resolution.

3. This Resolution shall be effective upon its passage.

ADOPTED this 7 day of October 2024, by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland,
by its Chairman, Paul C. Edwards, and attested by Kevin G. Null, County Administrator.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF GARRETT NTY, MARYLAND

(SEAL) M
By (SEAL)

PXUL C. EDWARDS
Chairman

ATTEST:

oMt/

KEVIN G. NULL
County Administrator




JERO0S MEQS

GARRETT COUINTY CODE OF ORDINANCE
PROCUREMENT — BIDS AND CONTRACTS ORDINANCE

AN ACT CONCERNING the Garrett County Code; FOR THE PURPOSE of increasing the minimum dollar
amount of contracts for which the Board of County Commissioners, or any employee of Garrett County, are
required to advertise for bids; exempting certain contracts for professional services from a requirement to
advertise for bids; authorizing certain contracts to be solicited by written bids; and generally relating to
procurement in Garrett County. Garrett County Code of Ordinances, §30.21 BIDS AND CONTRACTS.

(1) Except for transactions under division (D) of this section, PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
REQUIRED TO BE LICENSED BY THE STATE OF MARYLAND, or as otherwise authorized
by law, the Board of County Commissioners, or any employee of Garrett County, may not enter into
any contract of sale or purchase to which the county is a party where the amount involved under the
contract exceeds [$25,000] $50,000 without advertising for bids in one or more newspapers
circulated in the county. PROFESSIONAL SERVICES REQUIRED TO BE LICENSED BY
THE STATE OF MARYLAND MAY BE SOLICITED BY WRITTEN BIDS.

(2) The advertisement for bids shall appear at least a week prior to the date on which bids are to be filed.

(3) Any contract of sale shall be awarded to the highest responsible bidder, and any contract of purchase
shall be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder, but the Board of County Commissioners shall
have the right to reject any and all bids.

(4) Any contract entered into in violation of the provisions of this section shall be null and void. The
provisions of this section shall not apply to necessary repairs made in case of emergency. Ch. 693
2024 LAWS OF MARYLAND

(5) If any County Commissioner shall violate any provisions of this division, the Commissioner shall
be liable to indictment, and, upon conviction, shall forfeit the office.



”~ i

(o ) R e ..

THE BOARD OF GARRETT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
203 South Fourth Street - Courthouse - Room 207 Oakland, Maryland 21550
www.garrettcountymd.gov countycommissioners@garrettcountymd.gov

301-334-8970 7301-895-3188 FAX 301-334-5000
Board of Commissioners County Administrator
Paul C. Edwards Kevin G. Null
Ryan S. Savage
8. Larry Tichnell County Attorney

Gorman E. Getty 111

Garrett County Government

RESOLUTION 2024 - 13

GARRETT COUNTY MULTI-JURISDICTIONAL HAZARD MITIGATION PLAN 2024

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT
COUNTY, MARYLAND ADOPTING THE GARRETT COUNTY MULTI-
JURISDICTIONAL HAZARD MITIGATION PLAN, UPDATED 2024.

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland recognizes the threat that natural
hazards pose to people and property within Garrett County; and

WHEREAS, the County has prepared a multi-hazard mitigation plan, hereby known as the Garrett County Multi-
Jurisdictional Hazard Mitigation Plan, updated in 2024, in accordance with federal laws, including the Robert T.
Stafford Disaster Relief and Emergency Act, as amended; the National Flood Insurance Act of 1968, as amended;
and the National Dam Safety Program Act, as amended; and

WHEREAS, the mitigation plan identifies mitigation goals and actions to reduce or eliminate long-term risk to people
and property in the County from the impacts of future hazards and disasters; and

WHEREAS, the adoption by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland, demonstrates its
commitment to hazard mitigation and achieving the goals outlined in the Garrett County Multi-Jurisdictional Hazard
Mitigation Plan, updated 2024.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland formally
adopts the Garrett County Multi-Jurisdictional Hazard Mitigation Plan —updated 2024. While the content related
to the County may require revisions to meet the plan approval requirements, changes occurring after adoption will
not require the Board of County Commissioners to re-adopt any further iterations of the Plan. Subsequent Plan
updates following the approval period for the Plan will be require separate adoption resolutions.

ADOPTED this 7t day of OCTOBER, 2024, by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland,
signed by its Chairman, Paul C. Edwards, and attested by Kevin G. Null, County Administrator.

ATTEST: THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND

(SEAL)

By
KEVIN G. NULL PAUL C. EDWARDS
County Administrator Chairman



THE BOARD OF GAﬁf{‘}Eq‘{f db%ﬁT@ COMMISSIONERS

203 South Fourth Street - Courthouse - Room 207 Oakland, Maryland 21550
www.garrettcountymd.gov countycommissioners@garrettcountymd.gov

301-334-8970 301-895-3188 FAX 301-334-5000
Board of Commissioners County Administrator
Paul C. Edwards Kevin G. Null
Ryan S. Savage
S. Larry Tichnell County Attorney

Gorman E. Getty III

RESOLUTION NO. 2024 -14

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY,
MARYLAND, A BODY POLITIC AND CORPORATE AND GOVERNING BODY OF GARRETT
COUNTY, MARYLAND (“GARRETT COUNTY”), AMENDING AND RESTATING THE
PROVISIONS OF CHAPTER 34 OF THE CODE OF PUBLIC LOCAL LAWS OF GARRETT COUNTY,
MARYLAND (THE “COUNTY CODE”).

Explanation

The Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland, amend and restate the provisions
of Chapter 34 of the Code of Public Local Laws of Garrett County, Maryland (the “County Code”), to conform
the Code provisions and requests of the State of Maryland.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by Garrett County, as follows:

1.

2.

4.

The Explanation set forth above is incorporated as a substantive provision of this Resolution.

The Garrett County Public Ethics Ordinance, a copy of which is attached hereto and incorporated,
be and is hereby enacted, adopted and restated, in its entirety.

Except as specifically set forth, Garrett County ratifies and confirms all other provisions of Chapter
34 of the County Code.

This Resolution shall be effective upon its passage.

ADOPTED this 7% day of October 2024, by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County,
Maryland, by its Chairman, Paul C. Edwards, and attested by Kevin G. Null, County Administrator.

(SEAL)

ATTEST:

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF GARRET TY, MARYLAND

By ’A/%(SEAL)

PAUL C. EDWARDS
Chairman

KEVIN G. NULL
County Administrator



BTN o
s U

W e

e LD
AETEY W g 9

"»I:}

CHAPTER 34 — ETHICS PROVISIONS

Section 1. Short title. etk ot
This chapter may be cited as the Garrett County Public Ethics Ordinance.

Section 2. Applicability.

(a) The provisions of this chapter apply to all Garrett County elected officials, employees, and appointees
to boards and commissions of Garrett County, Maryland (the “County”).

(b) “Designated second home” means:
(1) If an individual owns one second home, the individual’s second home; or

(2) If an individual owns more than one second home, any one second home the individual
identifies to the Commission as the individual’s designated second home.

(¢) “Home address” means the address of an individual’s:
(1) Principal home; and
(2) Designated second home, if any.

(d) “Principal home” means the sole residential property that an individual occupies as the individual’s
primary residence, whether owned or rented by the individual.

(e) “Quasi-governmental entity” means an entity that is created by state statute, that performs a public
function, and that is supported in whole or in part by the state but is managed privately.

(f) “Second Home” means a residential property that:
(1) An individual occupies for some portion of the filing year; and

(2) Is not a rental property or a time share.

Section 3. Ethics Commission.
(a) There is a Garrett County Ethics Commission that consists of 3 members appointed by the County.
(b) The Commission shall:
(1) Devise, receive, and maintain all forms required by this chapter;

(2) Develop procedures and policies for advisory opinion requests and provide published
advisory opinions to persons subject to this chapter regarding the applicability of the
provisions of this chapter to them;

(3) Develop procedures and policies for the processing of complaints to make appropriate
determinations regarding complaints filed by any person alleging violations of this chapter;
and

(4) Conduct a public information program regarding the purposes and application of this chapter.
(c) The County Attorney shall advise the Commission.

(d) The Commission shall certify to the State Ethics Commission on or before October 1 of each year
that the County is incompliance with the requirements of General Provisions Article, Title 5, Subtitle
8, Annotated Code of Maryland, for elected local officials.

(¢) The Commission shall determine if changes to this chapter are required to be in compliance with the
requirements of General Provisions Article, Title 5, Subtitle 8, Annotated Code of Maryland, and
shall forward any recommended changes and amendments to the County for enactment.

(f) The Commission may adopt other policies and procedures to assist in the implementation of the
Commission’s programs established in this chapter.



ierafy =y L

erafs Y ) L)
WAU0 Y aR0020

Section 4. Conflicts of interest.
(a) In this section, “qualified relative” means a spouse, parent, child, or sibling.

(b) All County elected officials, officials appointed to County boards and commissions subject to this
chapter, and employees are subject to this section.

(c) Participation prohibitions. Except as permitted by Commission regulation or opinion, an official or
employee may not participate in:

(1) Except as permitted by Commission regulation or opinion, an official or employee may not
participate in:

(i) Except in the exercise of an administrative or ministerial duty that does not affect the
disposition or decision of the matter, any matter in which, to the knowledge of the
official or employee, the official or employee, or a qualified relative of the official
or employee has an interest;

(i) Except in the exercise of an administrative or ministerial duty that does not affect the
disposition or decision with respect to the matter, any matter in which any of the
following is a party;

(A) A business entity in which the official or employee has a direct financial
interest of which the official or employee may reasonably be expected to
know;

(B) A business entity for which the official, employee, or a qualified relative of
the official or employee is an officer, director, trustee, partner, or employee;

(C) A business entity with which the official or employee or, to the knowledge
of the official or employee, a qualified relative is negotiating employment or
has any arrangement concerning prospective employment.

(D) If the contract reasonably could be expected to result in a conflict between
the private interests of the official or employee and the official duties of the
official or employee, a business entity that is a party to an existing contract
with the official or employee, or which, to the knowledge of the official or
employee, is a party to a contract with a qualified relative;

(E) An entity, doing business with the County, in which a direct financial interest
is owned by another entity in which the official or employee has a direct
financial interest, if the official or employee may be reasonably expected to
know of both direct financial interests; or

(F) A business entity that:

1. The official or employee knows is a creditor or obligee of the official or
employee or a qualified relative of the official or employee with respect
to a thing of economic value; and

2. As a creditor or obligee, is in a position to directly and substantially
affect the interest of the official or employee or a qualified relative of
the official or employee.

(2) A person who is disqualified from participating under paragraphs (1)(i) or (ii) of this
subsection shall disclose the nature and circumstances of the conflict and may participate or
act if:

(i) The disqualification leaves a body with less than a quorum capable of acting;
(ii) The disqualified official or employee is required by law to act; or
(iii) The disqualified official or employee is the only person authorized to act.

(3) The prohibitions of paragraph 1(i) or (ii) of this subsection do not apply if participation is
allowed by regulation or opinion of the Commission.

2



FR009 BEOS2 |

(4) A former regulated lobbyist who is or becomes subject to this chapter as an employee or
official, other than an elected official or an appointed official, may not participate in a case,
contract, or other specific matter as an employee or official, other than an elected official or
appointed official, for one calendar year after the termination of the registration of the former
regulated lobbyist if the former regulated lobbyist previously assisted or represented another
party for compensation in the matter.

(d) Employment and financial interest restrictions.

(1) Except as permitted by regulation of the Commission when the interest is disclosed or when
the employment does not create a conflict of interest or appearance of conflict, an official or
employee may not:

(i) Be employed by or have a financial interest in any entity:

(A) Subject to the authority of the official or employee or the County agency,
board, commission with which the official or employee is affiliated; or

(B) That is negotiating or has entered a contract with the agency, board, or
commission with which the official or employee is affiliated; or

(ii) Hold any other employment relationship that would impair the impartiality or
independence of judgment of the official or employee.

(2) This prohibition does not apply to:

(i) An official or employee who is appointed to a regulatory or licensing authority
pursuant to a statutory requirement that persons subject to the jurisdiction of the
authority be represented in appointments to the authority;

(ii) Subject to other provisions of law, a member of a board or commission in regard to
a financial interest or employment held at the time of appointment, provided the
financial interest or employment is publicly disclosed to the appointing authority and
the Commission;

(iii) An official or employee whose duties are ministerial, if the private employment or
financial interest does not create a conflict of interest or the appearance of a conflict
of interest, as permitted by and in accordance with regulations adopted by the
Commission; or

(iv) Employment or financial interests allowed by regulation of the Commission if the
employment does not create a conflict of interest or the appearance of a conflict of
interest or the financial interest is disclosed.

(e) Post-employment limitations and restrictions.

(1) A former official or employee may not assist or represent any party other than the County
for compensation in a case, contract, or other specific matter involving the County if that
matter is one in which the former official or employee significantly participated as an official
or employee.

(2) A former elected official may not assist or represent another party for compensation in a
matter that is the subject of legislative action for one calendar year after the elected official
leaves office.

(f) Contingent compensation. Except in a judicial or quasi-judicial proceeding, an official or employee
may not assist or represent a party for contingent compensation in any matter before or involving the
County.

(g) Use of prestige of office.




009 MEDS22

) (i) An official or employee may not intentionally use the prestige of office or public
position:

(A) For the private gain of that official or employee or the private gain of
another; or

(B) To influence, except as part of the official duties of the official or employee
or as a usual and customary constituent service without additional
compensation, the award of a state or local contract to a specific person.

(ii) An official may not directly or indirectly initiate a solicitation for a person to retain
the compensated services of a particular regulated lobbyist or lobbying firm.

(2) This subsection does not prohibit the performance of usual and customary constituent
services by an elected local official without additional compensation.

3) (i) An official, other than an elected official, or employee may not use public resources
or the title of the official or employee to solicit a contribution as that term is defined
in the Election Law Article.

(i1) An elected official may not use public resources to solicit a contribution as that term
is defined in the Election Law Article.

(h) Solicitation and acceptance of gifts.

(1) An official or employee may not solicit any gift.

(2) An official or employee may not directly solicit or facilitate the solicitation of a gift, on behalf
of another person, from an individual regulated lobbyist.

(3) An official or employee may not knowingly accept a gift, directly or indirectly, from a person
that the official or employee knows or has the reason to know:

(i) Is doing business with or seeking to do business with the County office, agency,
board, or commission with which the official or employee is affiliated;

(ii) Has financial interests that may be substantially and materially affected, in a manner
distinguishable from the public generally, by the performance or nonperformance of
the official duties of the official or employee;

(iii) Is engaged in an activity regulated or controlled by the official’s or employee’s
governmental unit;

(iv) Is a lobbyist with respect to matters within the jurisdiction of the official or
employee; or

(v) Is an association, or any entity acting on behalf of an association that is engaged only
in representing counties or municipal corporations.

(4) Paragraph (5) of this subsection does not apply to a gift:

(i) That would tend to impair the impartiality and the independence of judgment of the
official or employee receiving the gift;

(ii) Of significant value that would give the appearance of impairing the impartiality and
independence of judgment of the official or employee; or

(iii) Of significant value that the recipient official or employee believes or has reason to
believe is designed to impair the impartiality and independence of judgment of the
official or employee.

(5) Notwithstanding paragraph (3) of this subsection, an official or employee may accept the
following:
(i) Meals and beverages consumed in the presence of the donor or sponsoring entity;

(ii) Ceremonial gifts or awards that have insignificant monetary value;
4



JER009 MEDS23

(iii) Unsolicited gifts of nominal value that do not exceed $20 in cost or trivial items of
informational value;

(iv) Reasonable expenses for food, travel, lodging, and scheduled entertainment of the
official or the employee at a meeting which is given in return for the participation of
the official or employee in a panel or speaking engagement at the meeting;

(v) Gifts of tickets or free admission extended to an elected local official to attend a
charitable, cultural, or political event, if the purpose of this gift or admission is a
courtesy or ceremony extended to the elected official’s office;

(vi) A specific gift or class of gifts that the Commission exempts from the operation of
this subsection upon a finding, in writing, that acceptance of the gift or class of gifts
would not be detrimental to the impartial conduct of the business of the County and
that the gift is purely personal and private in nature;

(vii) Gifts from a person related to the official or employee by blood or marriage, or any
other individual who is a member of the household of the official or employee; or

(viii) Honoraria for speaking to or participating in a meeting, provided that the offering
of the honorarium is not related in any way to the official’s or employee’s official
position.

(1) Disclosure of confidential information. Other than in the discharge of official duties, an official or
employee or former official or employee may not disclose or use confidential information, that the
official or employee acquired by reason of the individual’s public position or former public position
official’s and that is not available to the public, for the economic benefit of the official or employee
or that of another person.

(j) An official or employee may not retaliate against an individual for reporting or participating in an
investigation of a potential violation of the local ethics law or ordinance.
Section 5. Financial disclosure — local elected officials and candidates to be local elected officials.
(a) (1) This section applies to all local elected officials and candidates to be local elected officials.

(2) Except as provided in subsection (b) of this section, a local elected official or a candidate to
be a local elected official shall file the financial disclosure statement required under this
section:

(i) On a form provided by the Commission;
(i1) Under oath or affirmation; and
(iii) With the Commission.

(3) Deadlines for filing statements.

(i) An incumbent local elected official shall file a financial disclosure statement
annually no later than April 30 of each year for the preceding calendar year.

(i) An individual who is appointed to fill a vacancy in an office for which a financial
disclosure statement is required and who has not already filed a financial disclosure
statement shall file a statement for the preceding calendar year within 30 days after
appointment.

(iii)  (A) An individual who, other than by reason of death, leaves an office for which
a statement is required shall file a statement within 60 days after leaving the
office.

(B) The statement shall cover:

1. The calendar year immediately preceding the year in which the
individual left office, unless a statement covering that year has

already been filed by the individual; and

5



G009 mEOO2L
2. The portion of the current calendar year during which the individual
held the office.

(b) Candidates to be local elected officials.

(1) Except for an official who has filed a financial disclosure statement under another provision
of this section for the reporting period, a candidate to be an elected local official shall file a
financial disclosure statement each year beginning with the year in which the certificate of
candidacy is filed through the year of the election.

(2) A candidate to be an elected local official shall file a statement required under this section:

(i) In the year the certificate of candidacy is filed, no later than the filing of the
certificate of candidacy;

(i) In the year of the election, on or before the earlier of April 30 or the last day for the
withdrawal of candidacy; and

(iii) In all other years for which a statement is required, on or before April 30.
(3) A candidate to be an elected official:

(i) May file the statement required under §5(b)(2)(i) of this chapter with the County
Administrator or Board of Election Supervisors with the certificate of candidacy or
with the Commission prior to filing the certificate of candidacy; and

(ii) Shall file the statements required under §5(b)(2)(ii) and (iii) with the Commission.

(4) If a statement required to be filed by a candidate is overdue and not filed within 8 days after
written notice of the failure to file is provided by the County Administrator or Board of
Election Supervisor, the candidate is deemed to have withdrawn the candidacy.

(5) The County Administrator or Board of Election Supervisors may not accept any certificate
of candidacy unless a statement has been filed in proper form.

(6) Within 30 days of the receipt of a statement required under this section, the County
Administrator or Board of Election Supervisors shall forward the statement to the
Commission or the office designated by the Commission.

(c) Public record.

(1) The Commission or office designated by the Commission shall maintain all financial
disclosure statements filed under this section.

(2) Financial disclosure statements shall be made available during normal office hours for
examination and copying by the public subject to reasonable fees and administrative
procedures established by the Commission.

(3) If an individual examines or copies a financial disclosure statement, the Commission or the
office designated by the Commission shall record:

(i) The name and home address of the individual reviewing or copying the statement; and
(ii) The name of the person whose financial disclosure statement was examined or
copied.

(4) Upon request by the official or employee whose financial disclosure statement was examined
or copied, the Commission or the office designated by the Commission shall provide the
official with a copy of the name and home address of the person who reviewed the official’s
financial disclosure statement.

(5) For statements filed after January 1, 2019, the Commission or the office designated by the
Commission may not provide public access to an individual’s home address that the
individual has designated as the individual’s home address.

(6) The Commission or office designated by the Commission shall not provide public access to
information related to consideration received from:

6



JBRO0S BEDS23
(i) The University of Maryland Medical System;

(i1) A governmental entity of the State or a local government in the State; or
(iii) A quasi-governmental entity of the State or local government in the State.

(d) Retention requirements. The Commission or the office designated by the Commission shall retain
financial disclosure statements for four years from the date of receipt.

(¢) An individual who is required to disclose the name of a business under this section shall disclose any
other names that the business is trading as or doing business as.

(f) Contents of statement.
(1) Interests in real property.

(1) A statement filed under this section shall include a schedule of all interests in real
property wherever located.

(ii) For each interest in real property, the schedule shall include:

(A) The nature of the property and the location by street address, mailing
address, or legal description of the property;

(B) The nature and extent of the interest held, including any conditions and
encumbrances on the interest;

(C) The date when, the manner in which, and the identity of the person from
whom the interest was acquired,;

(D) The nature and amount of the consideration given in exchange for the interest
or, if acquired other than by purchase, the fair market value of the interest at
the time acquired;

(E) If any interest was transferred, in whole or in part, at any time during the
reporting period, a description of the interest transferred, the nature and
amount of the consideration received for the interest, and the identity of the
person to whom the interest was transferred; and

(F) The identity of any other person with an interest in the property.
(2) Interests in corporations and partnerships.

(i) A statement filed under this section shall include a schedule of all interests in any
corporation, partnership, limited liability partnership, or limited liability corporation,
regardless of whether the corporation or partnership does business with the County.

(ii) For each interest reported under this paragraph, the schedule shall include:

(A) The name and address of the principal office of the corporation, partnership,
limited liability partnership, or limited liability corporation;

(B) The nature and amount of the interest held, including any conditions and
encumbrances on the interest;

(C) With respect to any interest transferred, in whole or in part, at any time
during the reporting period, a description of the interest transferred, the
nature and amount of the consideration received for the interest, and, if
known, the identity of the person to whom the interest was transferred; and

(D) With respect to any interest acquired during the reporting period:

1. The date when, the manner in which, and the identity of the person
from whom the interest was acquired; and

2. The nature and the amount of the consideration given in exchange
for the interest or, if acquired other than by purchase, the fair market
value of the interest at the time acquired.



UERO0 9 BEDS28
(iii) An individual may satisfy the requirement to report the amount of the interest held
under item (ii)(B) of this paragraph by reporting, instead of a dollar amount:

(A) For an equity interest in-a corporation, the number of shares held and, unless
the corporation’s stock is publicly traded, the percentage of equity interest
held; or

(B) For an equity interest in a partnership, the percentage of equity interest held.
(3) Interests in business entities doing business with the County.

(i) A statement filed under this section shall include a schedule of all interests in any
business entity that does business with the County, other than interests reported
under paragraph (2) of this subsection.

(i1) For each interest reported under this paragraph, the schedule shall include:
(A) The name and address of the principal office of the business entity;

(B) The nature and amount of the interest held, including any conditions to and
encumbrances on the interest;

(C) With respect to any interest transferred, in whole or in part, at any time
during the reporting period, a description of the interest transferred, the
nature and amount of the consideration received in exchange for the interest,
and, if known, the identity of the person to whom the interest was
transferred; and

(D) With respect to any interest acquired during the reporting period:

1. The date when, the manner in which, and the identity of the person
from whom the interest was acquired; and

2. The nature and the amount of the consideration given in exchange
for the interest or, if acquired other than by purchase, the fair market
value of the interest at the time acquired.

(4) Gifts.

(i) A statement filed under this section shall include a schedule of each gift in excess of
$20 in value or a series of gifts totaling $100 or more received during the reporting
period from or on behalf of, directly or indirectly, any one person who does business
with the County, or from an association, or any entity acting on behalf of an
association that is engaged only in representing counties or municipal corporations.

(i1) For each gift reported, the schedule shall include:
(A) A description of the nature and value of the gift; and

(B) The identity of the person from whom, or on behalf of whom, directly or
indirectly, the gift was received.

(5) Employment with or interests in entities doing business with the County.

(i) A statement filed under this section shall include a schedule of all offices,
directorships, and salaried employment by the individual or member of the
immediate family of the individual held at any time during the reporting period with
entities doing business with the County.

(ii) For each position reported under this paragraph, the schedule shall include:
(A) The name and address of the principal office of the business entity;

(B) The title and nature of the office, directorship, or salaried employment held
and the date it commenced; and

(C) The name of each County agency with which the entity is involved.



EAAAD LEN T AT
WROO0S BEQS 27

(6) Indebtedness to entities doing business with or regulated by the individual’s County unit or
department.

(i) A statement filed under this section shall include a schedule of all liabilities,
excluding retail credit accounts, to persons doing business with or regulated by the
individual’s County unit or department owed at any time during the reporting period:

(A) By the individual; or

(B) By a member of the immediate family of the individual if the individual was
involved in the transaction giving rise to the liability.

(ii) For each liability reported under this paragraph, the schedule shall include:

(A) The identity of the person to whom the liability was owed and the date the
liability was incurred,

(B) The amount of the liability owed as of the end of the reporting period;

(C) The terms of payment of the liability and the extent to which the principal
amount of the liability was increased or reduced during the year; and

(D) The security given, if any, for the liability.

(7) A statement filed under this section shall include a schedule of the immediate family
members of the individual employed by the County in any capacity at any time during the
reporting period.

(8) Sources of earned income.

(i) A statement filed under this section shall include a schedule of the name and address
of each place of employment and of each business entity of which the individual or
a member of the individual’s immediate family was a sole or partial owner and from
which the individual or member of the individual’s immediate family received
earned income, at any time during the reporting period.

(ii) A minor child’s employment or business ownership need not be disclosed if the
agency that employs the individual does not regulate, exercise authority over, or
contract with the place of employment or business entity of the minor child.

(iii) For a statement filed on or after January 1, 2019, if the individual’s spouse is a
lobbyist regulated by the County, the individual shall disclose the entity that has
engaged the spouse for lobbying purposes.

(9) Relationship with University of Maryland Medical System, State or Local Government, or
Quasi-Governmental Entity.

(i) An individual shall disclose the information specified in General Provisions Article
§5-607(j)(1), Annotated Code of Maryland, for any financial or contractual
relationship with:

(A) The University of Maryland Medical System;
(B) A governmental entity of the State or a local government in the State; or

(C) A quasi-governmental entity of the State or local government in the State.

(i1) For each financial or contractual relationship reported, the schedule shall include:
(A) A description of the relationship;
(B) The subject matter of the relationship; and
(C) The consideration.



JERO09 BEDS28

(10) A statement filed under this section may also include a schedule of additional interests or
information that the individual making the statement wishes to disclose.

(g) For the purposes of §5(f)(1), (2), and 3) of this chapter, the following interests are considered to be
the interests of the individual making the statement:

(1) An interest held by a member of the individual’s immediate family, if the interest was, at any
time during the reporting period, directly or indirectly controlled by the individual.

(2) An interest held, at any time during the applicable period, by:
(1) A business entity in which the individual held a 10% or greater interest;

(ii) A business entity described in item (i) of this subsection in which the business entity
held a 25% or greater interest;

(iii) A business entity described in item (ii) of this subsection in which the business entity
held a 50% or greater interest; and

(iv) A business entity in which the individual directly or indirectly, though an intertest in
one or a combination of other business entities, holds a 10% or greater interest.

(3) An interest held by a trust or an estate in which, at any time during the reporting period:
(i) The individual held a reversionary interest or was a beneficiary; or

(ii) If a revocable trust, the individual was a settlor.

(h) (1) The Commission shall review the financial disclosure statements submitted under this section
for compliance with the provisions of this section and shall notify an individual submitting
the statement of any omissions or deficiencies.

(2) The County Ethics Commission may take appropriate enforcement action to ensure
compliance with this section.

Section 6. Financial disclosure — employees and appointed officials.

(a) This section only applies to the following appointed officials and employees:

(1) County Commissioners
(2) County Administrator
(3) County Attorney
(4) County Health Officer
Directors/Division Chiefs/Managers of:
(5) Department of Emergency Services
(6) Department of Financial Services
— Purchasing Division Chief
(7) Department of Human Resources
(8) Department of Community Development
— Airport Division Chief
— Business Development Manager
— Planning Assistant Director
(9) Department of Public Works
— Capital Projects Division Chief
— Engineering Division Chief
— Facilities & Maintenance Division Chief
— Roads Division Chief
— Utilities Division Chief
— Solid Waste & Recycling Division Chief
(10) Department of Technology & Communications
(11) Ruth Enlow Library of Garrett County

10



JERO0S w0029

(b) A statement filed under this section shall be filed with the Commission under oath or affirmation.

(c) On or before April 30 of each year during which an official or employee holds office, an official or
employee shall file a statement disclosing gifts received during the preceding calendar year from any
person that contracts with or is regulated by the County, including the name of the business entity in
which the individual directly or indirectly, though an interest in one or a combination of other
business entities, holds a 10% or greater interest. The donor of the gift and the approximate retail
value at the time or receipt.

(d) An official or employee shall disclose employment and interests that raise conflicts of interest or
potential conflicts of interest in connection with a specific proposed action by the employee or official
sufficiently in advance of the action to provide adequate disclosure to the public.

(e) An individual who is required to disclose the name of a business under this section shall disclose any
other names that the business is trading as or doing business as.

(f) Relationship with University of Maryland Medical System, State or Local Government, or Quasi-
Governmental Entity.

(1) An individual shall disclose the information specified in General Provisions Article §5-
607()(1), Annotated Code of Maryland, for any financial or contractual relationship with:

(i) The University of Maryland Medical System;
(ii) A governmental entity of the State or a local government in the State; or
(iii) A quasi-governmental entity of the State or local government in the State.
(2) For each financial or contractual relationship reported, the schedule shall include:

(1) A description of the relationship;
(ii) The subject matter of the relationship; and
(iii) The consideration.

(g) The Commission shall maintain all disclosure statements filed under this section as public records

available for public inspection and copying as provided in §5(c) and (d) of this chapter.
Section 7. Lobbying.
(a) A person shall file a lobbying registration statement with the Commission if the person:

(1) personally appears before a County official or employee with the intent to influence that
person in performance of the official duties of the official or employee; and

(2) in connection with the intent to influence, expends or reasonably expects to expend in a given
calendar year in excess of $500 on food, entertainment, or other gifts for officials or
employees of the County.

(b) A person shall file a registration statement required under this section on or before the later of January
15 of the calendar year or within 5 days after first performing an act that requires registration in the
calendar year.

(©) (1) The registration statement shall identify:
(i) The registrant;
(ii) Any other person on whose behalf the registrant acts; and

(iii) The subject matter on which the registrant proposes to make appearances specified
in subsection (a) of this section.

(2) The registration statement shall cover a defined registration period not to exceed one calendar
year.

(d) Within 30 days after the end of any calendar year during which a person was registered under this
section, the person shall file a report with the Commission disclosing:

11



it Iakel

JEROO 9 BERS30
(1) The value, date, and nature of any food, entertainment, or other gift provided to a County
official or employee; and

(2) If a gift or series of gifts to a single official or employee exceeds $500 in value, the identity
of the official or employee.

(e) The Commission shall maintain the registrations and reports filed under this section as public records
available for public inspection and copying for four years after receipt by the Commission.
Section 8. Exemptions and modifications.

The Commission may grant exemptions and modifications to the provisions of §§4 and 6 of this chapter to
employees and to appointed members of County Boards and Commissions, when the Commission finds that an
exemption or modification would not be contrary to the purposes of this chapter, and the application of this chapter
would:

(a) Constitute an unreasonable invasion of privacy; and

(b) Significantly reduce the availability of qualified persons for public service.

Section 9. Enforcement.
(a) The Commission may:

(1) Assess a late fee of $5 per day up to a maximum of $500 for a failure to timely file a financial
disclosure statement required under §5 or 6 of this chapter;

(2) Assess a late fee of $10 per day up to a maximum of $1,000 for a failure to file a timely
lobbyist registration or lobbyist report required under §7 of this chapter; and

(3) Issue a cease and desist order against any person found to be in violation of this chapter.

(b) (1) Upon a finding of a violation of any provision of this chapter, the Commission may:

(i) Issue an order of compliance directing the respondent to cease and desist from the
violation;

(ii) Issue a reprimand; or

(iii) Recommend to the appropriate authority other appropriate discipline of the
respondent, including censure or removal if that discipline is authorized by law.

(2) If the Commission finds that a respondent has violated §7 of this chapter, the Commission
may:

(i) Require a respondent who is a registered lobbyist to file any additional reports or
information that reasonably related to the information that is required under §7 of
this chapter;

(ii) Impose a fine not exceeding $5,000 for each violation; and

(iii) Suspend the registration of an individual registered lobbyist if the Commission finds
that the lobbyist has knowingly and willfully violated §7 of this chapter or has been
convicted of a criminal offense arising from lobbying activities.

(©) (1) Upon request of by the Commission, the County Attorney may file a petition for injunctive
or other relief in the Circuit Court of Garrett County, or in any other court having proper
venue for the purpose of requiring compliance with the provisions of this chapter.

2) (i) The court may:
(A) Issue an order to cease and desist from the violation;
(B) Except as provided in subparagraph (ii) of this paragraph, void an official
action taken by an official or employee with a conflict of interest prohibited

by this chapter when the action arises from or concerns the subject matter of
the conflict and if the legal action is brought within 90 days of the occurrence

12



JR009 MEOS 3
of the official action, if the court deems voiding the action to be in the best
interest of the public; or

(C) Impose a fine of up to $5,000 for any violation of the provisions of this
chapter, with each day upon which the violation occurs constituting a
separate offense.

(ii) A court may not void any official action appropriating public funds, levying taxes,
or providing for the issuance of bonds, notes, or other evidences of public
obligations.

(d) In addition to any other enforcement provisions in this chapter, a person who the Commission or a
court finds has violated this chapter:

(1) Is subject to termination or other disciplinary action; and

(2) May be suspended from receiving payment of salary or other compensation pending full
compliance with the terms of an order of the Commission or a court.

(e) A County official or employee found to have violated this chapter is subject to disciplinary or other
appropriate personnel action, including removal from office, disciplinary action, suspension of salary,
or other sanction.

(f) Violation of §7 of this chapter shall be a misdemeanor subject to a fine of up to $10,000 or
imprisonment of up to one year.

(g) A finding of a violation of this chapter by the Commission is public information.

13



JERQ09 Mr0532
THE BOARD OF GARRETT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

203 South Fourth Street - Courthouse - Room 207 Oakland, Maryland 21550
www.garrettcountymd.gov  countycommissioners@garrettcountymd.gov

301-334-8970 ..~301-895-3188 FAX 301-334-5000
Board of Commissioners County Administrator
Paul C. Edwards Kevin G. Null
Ryan S. Savage
S. Larry Tichnell County Attorney

Gorman E. Getty 111

BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE 24 00T 1
Adoption of the 2021 International Building Code, the 2021 International Residential Code,
and the 2021 International Energy Conservation Code.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, A BODY
POLITIC AND CORPORATE AND A POLITICAL SUBDIVISION OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND, PURSUANT TO THE
PROVISIONS OF PUBLIC SAFETY ARTICLE 12 SUB-SECTIONS 501-507 OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND
(THE "STATE CODE") REPEALING AND ADOPTING THE ‘GARRETT COUNTY BUILDING CODE' (THE "CODE”)
PURSUANT TO THE PROVISIONS OF THE GARRETT COUNTY CODE, THE SAME BEING ARTICLE 12, OF THE CODE
OF PUBLIC LOCAL LAWS OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND, REGULATING AND PROVIDING FOR MINIMUM
STANDARDS GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION, ENLARGEMENT, REPAIR, DEMOLITION,
REMOVAL AND USE OF CERTAIN BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; REGULATING THE FABRICATION, ERECTION,
CONSTRUCTION, ENLARGEMENT, ALTERATION, REPAIR AND USE OF ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS, THEIR
APPURTENANCES AND ACCESSORY STRUCTURES; AND PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF BUILIDNG PERMITS,
REVIEW OF CONSTRUCTION DRAWINGS, INSPECTIONS OF THE WORK, ISSUANCE OF CERTIFICATES OF USE AND
OCCUPANCY PERMITS AS REQUIRED, AND THE COLLECTION OF PERMIT AND ASSOCIATED FEES; AND PROVIDING
PENALTIES FOR VIOLATION THEREOF.

EXPLANATION

WHEREAS, Pursuant to Public Safety Article Subtitle 12, Chapter 51, the State of Maryland has adopted a
uniform building code known as the Maryland Building Performance Standards and directed that local jurisdictions
are responsible for the implementation and enforcement of the Maryland Building Performance Standards within
their jurisdiction; and

WHEREAS, the Maryland Building Performance Standards specifies that the building codes in the State of
Maryland shall be the International Building Code 2021 (IBC-21), the International Residential Code 2021 (IRC-21)
and the International Energy Conservation Code 2021 (IECC-21) (the “2021 Building Codes”); and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland (the "County") has determined
that the adoption and implementation of these Building Codes is necessary to promote the health, safety and
welfare of the citizens of Garrett County; and

WHEREAS, the County has determined what local amendments to the Maryland Building Performance
Standards are necessary or desirable for Garrett County and have reviewed the comments on these amendments
received in writing and at public hearing.

NOW, THEREFORE, be it enacted and ordained by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County,
Maryland, a body politic and Corporate and a political subdivision of the State of Maryland that the Building Code
Ordinance effective July 1, 2015 and adopted by the Board of County Commissioners and incorporated within the
County Code of Ordinance Title XV, Chapter 150, Section 150.02, 150.03, and 150.04, is hereby repealed in its
entirety; and the 2021 Building Codes, subject to the local amendments be and are hereby adopted as follows;



NOW THEREFORE, be it enacted and ordained that the Board of County Commissioners do hereby enact the

following ordinance with amendments to be included within the County Code of Ordinance, Title XV, Chapter 150,
Sections 150.02, 150.03 and 150.04. e

ARTICLE |. ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE BY REFERENCE

The International Building Code 2021 (hereinafter referred to as the Code) published by the International Code
Council, Inc, is hereby adopted and by reference thereto is made a part of this chapter with the same force and
effect as though set out in full herein, save and except such changes, amendments, revisions, deletions, substitutions
and/or additions as are specified in this chapter. If conflicts arise between this code and other codes adopted by
the State of Maryland or Garrett County, the more restrictive provisions shall govern.

At least one copy of this code and supplements thereto shall be on file and open for public use, examination, and
inspection in the offices of the Garrett County Department of Community Development Permits & Inspections
Division.

Section 1. Modifications to the International Building Code

1.

10.

Chapter 1, Section 101.1 Title is hereby amended by inserting "GARRETT COUNTY" as the “[NAME OF
JURISDICTION]”.

Chapter 1, Section 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency shall be amended to read as follows: “The Garrett
County Department of Community Development, Permits & Inspections Division shall be responsible for
administration and enforcement of this code. The building official shall be the staff person(s) designated
within the Permits & Inspections Division responsible for enforcing the provisions of the code.

Chapter 1, Section 104.10.1 Flood hazard areas is deleted and replaced with the following: “Flood hazard
areas. Modifications to any provisions required in flood hazard areas shall only be granted in compliance with
Appendix G of this chapter.”

Chapter 1, Add a new Section to read as follows: “104.12 Withholding of Permits: Whenever the building
official shall find that any person, agent, firm or corporation, whether as owner, lessee or occupant is in
violation of the provisions of this code or of the rules and regulations of any other department or agency of
Garrett County in connection with the erection, or repair of buildings, structures, lands, or equipment then or
therein, they may refuse to grant any further permits or inspections until all violations have been corrected
and approved."

Chapter 1, Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit exemption 1. is hereby amended by deleting “120 square
feet” and inserting “240 square feet”.

Chapter 1, Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit is amended by adding the following exemption: "14.
Agricultural structures: The provisions of this Code shall not apply to the construction, maintenance or
alternation of buildings or structures on farms which are zoned or assessed agricultural and used only for
agricultural pursuits if such buildings and/or structures are not intended for, nor used for, human occupancy."

Chapter 1, Section 105.3 Application for permit is hereby amended by deleting the words "file an application
therefor in writing on a form furnished by the department of building safety for that purpose" and inserting
"make application to the Permits & Inspections Division".

Chapter 1, Section 105.5 Expiration is hereby amended by deleting “180 days” and inserting “one year” in all
instances.

Chapter 1, Section 107.1 General is hereby amended by deleting “a registered design professional where
required by the statutes of the jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed” in the second sentence
and inserting “a Maryland licensed architect and/or structural engineer”.

Chapter 1, Section 107.1 General is amended by adding the following “Exception 2. The building official is
authorized to waive the requirement that construction documents be submitted by a Maryland licensed
architect and/or structural engineer if the submitted construction documents are found to sufficiently



11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

mra M ST T ot
ERO09 MEOS 3L

illustrate compliance with all pertinent code requirements. Documents should include a detailed floor plan
and show footings and foundations; means of egress; framing and structural elements; and insulation values
as applicable to the project.

Chapter 1, Section 107.2.2 Fire proteétibh system shop drawings is amended by inserting “to the Maryland
State Fire Marshal” after the word “submitted”.

Chapter 1, Section 107.2.6 Site Plan is hereby amended by deleting the first word "The" and inserting the
following phrase in lieu thereof "In those instances when a proposed building project is commercial, industrial,
multi family, and/or located within an area of the County or municipality where zoning regulations require a site
plan,".

Chapter 1, Section 109.2 Schedule of permit fees is amended by deleting “the applicable governing authority”
and inserting “resolution of the Board of County Commissioners.”

Chapter 1, Section 109.6 Refunds is deleted, and the following is inserted is lieu thereof: "109.6 Refunds: Where
no work has been done under a permit issued under this chapter, the holder of the permit may deliver the
permit to the Permits & Inspections Division, and upon cancellation thereof shall be refunded 50% of the fee
paid therefore provided that the application for the refund is made within 12 months of permit issuance. When
a permit is disapproved or withdrawn, the applicant shall be refunded 50% of the fee paid. In either case, no
refund shall be made until all plan examination fees, permit processing fees, and all penalties which may have
been imposed on the permit holder under the requirements of this Code shall first be collected.”

Chapter 1, SECTION 111 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY Add a new Section 111.3.1 to read as follows "111.3.1
Partial occupancy. Upon request of the holder of a permit, the building official shall issue a partial occupancy
permit for a part of the building or structure before the entire work covered by the permit shall have been
completed if that part of the building may be occupied safely prior to full completion of the building or structure
without endangering life or public welfare. Partial occupancy permits shall be reviewed by the building official
every twelve months from date of issue to ascertain the status of the full completion of the building or structure.
If no substantial work is accomplished on the building or structure within 12 months after the partial occupancy
permit date of issue, the original building permit will be invalid and to complete the building or structure another
building permit must be obtained. This section is not intended to displace persons residing within the structure
pending the completion of the structure approved under the original permit.”

Chapter 1, Section 113.3 Qualifications is deleted and the following inserted in lieu thereof: "113.3
Qualifications. The Board of Appeals shall consist of five individuals, one from each of the following professions
or disciplines:

Registered design professional who is an architect or engineer.

Home builder with at least five years of experience.

General contractor for commercial/industrial construction with at least five years of experience.

Electrical contractor duly certified by the appropriate jurisdiction with at least five years of experience.

5. Plumbing contractor duly certified by the appropriate jurisdiction with at least five years of experience.

=W N

Chapter 1, Section 114 Violation penalties is amended by adding “Section 114.4.1 Construction without a
building permit. Any person who shall attempt to erect, construct, alter, repair, or move a structure, make a
change in occupancy, or install or alter any equipment which is regulated by this code without a valid permit
issued by the building official shall be guilty of a misdemeanor punishable by a fine of $250 for the first offense,
$500 for the second offense and $1000 for the third offense and each succeeding offense. Each day that
construction continues after due notice has been served the party in violation shall be subject to the fine for the
applicable offense.

Chapter 1, Section Violation penalties isamended by adding Section 114.4.2 Other code violations: Any person
who shall violate a provision of this code other than the violation defined in 114.4.1 above or shall fail to comply
with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a building or structure in
violation of an approved plan or directive of the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the
provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of $250 for the first offense, $500



19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

k009 BIEDS 35

for the second offense and $1000 for the third offense and each succeeding offense, or by imprisonment not
exceeding thirty 30 days or both such fine and imprisonment and regardless of the penalty duly adjudged shall
be required to correct the violation. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall
be deemed a separate offense."

Chapter 1, SECTION 114 VIOLATIONS is amended by adding “Section 114.5 Enforcement, suspension, or
revocation of permits, inspections, and use and occupancy permits.
A. Enforcement procedure.

1. When the building official, or his representative, determines that a violation of the Building Code,
standard construction controls, or the provisions of this chapter has occurred, the on-site general
contractor or building permittee shall be notified in writing of the violation and of the required
corrective action and the time period in which to have the violation corrected.

2. If the violation persists after the date specified for corrective action in the notice of violation, the
Permits & Inspections Division shall stop work on the site by the issuance of a stop work order pursuant
to Section 115 of this chapter.

3. If reasonable efforts to correct the violation are not undertaken in a timely manner, the Permits &
Inspections Division may refer the violation for legal action.

4. The Permits & Inspections Division may deny or recommend denial of the issuance of any permit to an
applicant when it determines that the applicant is not in compliance with the Building Code, standard
construction controls, or the provisions of this Chapter on any site.

5. Any step in this enforcement process may be taken at any time, depending upon the severity of the
violation.

B. Suspension or revocation of permits, inspections and use and occupancy certificates by the building official
after notice.

1. Uncorrected violations of the Building Code, standard construction controls, or the provisions of this
Chapter or any other applicable law, ordinance, rule or regulation relating to the work involving any
Permits & Inspections Division or agency of Garrett County may result in the suspension or revocation
of permits, inspections or licenses.

2. Existence of any condition or the doing of any act constituting or creating a nuisance, hazard, or
endangerment of human life or property of others may result in the suspension or revocation of permits,
inspections or licenses.

C. If conditions warrant, no notice of violation is necessary and the Permits & Inspections Division, may
proceed directly with
1. astop work order,
2. legal action; or
3. suspension or revocation of permits, inspections and/or use and occupancy certificates.

Chapter 1, Section 115.4 Failure to comply is hereby amended by deleting “subject to fines established by the
authority having jurisdiction” and inserting “subject to a fine of $250 for the first offense, $500 for the second
offense and $1000 for the third offense and each succeeding offense.”

Chapter 3, Section 305.2 Group E, day care facilities is amended by deleting “five children” and inserting “eight
children”.

Chapter 3, Section 308.5 Institutional Group I-4, day care facilities is amended by deleting “five persons” and
inserting “eight persons”.

Chapter 3, Section 308.5.1 Classification as Group E is amended by adding the following: “Exception: A childcare
facility may be classified as I-4 when the facility is classified as a day care occupancy under the State Fire
Prevention Code.”

Chapter 3, Section 310.4.1 Care facilities within a dwelling is amended by deleting “five or fewer persons” and
inserting “eight or fewer persons”.



25.

26.

27.

28.

29.

30.

31.

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

IRISA N M s ”

RSN G mEn gl
LakDUY B0 536

Chapter 4, Section 401.1 Detailed occupancy and use requirements, is amended by adding the following: “The
construction, location, anchorage and tie down of mobile units will be governed by Appendix AE of the
International Residential Code.”

E &

Chapter 4, Section 406.2.7 Electric vehicle charging stations and systems, is amended by deleting the final
sentence “Accessibility to electric vehicle charging stations shall be provided in accordance with Section 1107”.

Chapter 4, Section 411.5 Puzzle room exiting is amended by deleting item 3 and replacing it with “3. All exits
and exit access doors from each puzzle room shall be open and readily available upon activation by the
automatic fire alarm system, automatic sprinkler system, a manual control at a constantly attended location
and shall have a readily accessible control located inside each puzzle room.”

Chapter 5, Section 510.2 Horizontal building separation allowance is amended by deleting condition 4.
Condition 7 is amended by replacing “grade plane” with “lowest level of fire department vehicle access”.

Chapter 9, Section 901.1 Scope is amended by adding the following: “Fire protection system requirements of
Chapter 9 may be concurrently covered in the State Fire Prevention Code, Public Safety Article Title 6 and Title
9, Annotated Code of Maryland, and COMAR 29.06.01. The State Fire Prevention Code is enforced by the State
Fire Marshal or authorized fire official.”

Chapter 9, Section 907.2.1.1 System initiation in Group A occupancies with an occupant load of 1,000 or more
is amended by replacing “1,000” with “300”

Chapter 10, Section 1001.1 General is amended by adding the following: “Means of egress requirements of
Chapter 10 may be concurrently covered in the State Fire Prevention Code, Public Safety Article, Title 6,
Annotated Code of Maryland, and COMAR 29.06.01. The State Fire Prevention Code is enforced by the State
Fire Marshal or authorized fire official.”

Section 1004.8 Concentrated business use areas is amended by adding “nail salons,” after “call centers,” and
before “trading floors”.

Chapter 11 Accessibility is hereby replaced with the Maryland Accessibility Code, as set forth in COMAR
09.12.53.

Chapter 16, Section 1608.2 Ground snow loads is amended by adding the following sentence to the end of the
section: “The minimum ground snow load for Garrett County shall be 40 Ibs. per sq. ft.”

Chapter 16, Section 1612 Flood Loads is deleted, and the following is inserted in lieu thereof: "1612 All buildings
and structures erected in areas prone to flooding shall be regulated by Appendix G of this chapter.

Chapter 17, Section 1705.1.1, Special Cases is hereby amended by adding a new example: “#4: In damaged
structures, reuse of fire damaged wood is acceptable if the damage does not significantly reduce its load bearing
capacity. A special inspection shall be required to identify and verify all remaining wood members to be used in
reconstruction. All remaining charred or smoked wood members, whether structural or not, shall be thoroughly
cleaned and sealed to prevent deterioration and control odor.”

Chapter 18, Section 1805.1 General is deleted, and the following is inserted in lieu thereof: “1805.1 Where
required. Walls or portions thereof that retain earth shall be waterproofed and damp-proofed in accordance
with this section. Ventilation for crawlspaces shall comply with Section 1202.4.”

Chapter 18, Section 1809.5 Frost protection method #1 is hereby amended by adding “which shall be thirty-six
(36) inches for Garrett County, Maryland" after the word "locality".

Chapter 24 GLASS AND GLAZING, Section 2401.1 Scope is amended by adding the following: “The requirements
for safety glazing set forth in Public Safety Article, Title 12, Subtitle 4 of the Annotated Code of Maryland, are in
addition to Chapter 24, Section 2406 of the IBC related to safety glazing. In the event of a conflict between
Chapter 24 of the IBC and the Annotated Code of Maryland, the requirements of the Annotated Code of
Maryland prevail.”



EIONG0 NS 2T
,:%;KSUQ Qo037

40. Chapter 27 ELECTRICAL, Section 2701.1 Scope is amended by adding the following: “For the applicable electrical
requirements, refer to the Garrett County Electrical Code Ordinance and the National Electrical Code as adopted
and enforced by the State Fire Marshal pursuant to the provisions of the Public Safety Article, Title12, Subtitle
6, Annotated Code of Maryland.”

41. Chapter 28 MECHANICAL SYSTEMS, Section 2801.1 Scope is amended by adding the following: “For the
applicable requirements concerning mechanical systems, refer to the Garrett County Mechanical Code and the
mechanical code adopted pursuant to the Business Regulation Article, 9A-205, Annotated Code of Maryland.”

42. Chapter 29 PLUMBING SYSTEMS, Section 9801.1 Scope is amended by adding the following: “For the applicable
requirements concerning plumbing systems, refer to the Garrett County Plumbing Code Ordinance and the
plumbing code adopted pursuant to the Business Occupations and Professions Article, Title 12, Annotated Code
of Maryland.”

43. Chapter 30, ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS, Section 3001.1 Scope is amended by adding the following:
“The provisions of this chapter relate to elevators and conveying systems and are in addition to, and not instead
of, the requirements set forth in the Public Safety Article, Title 12, Subtitle 8, Annotated Code of Maryland. In
the event of a conflict between the IBC and the Annotated Code of Maryland, the provisions of the Annotated
Code of Maryland prevail.”

44. Chapter 31, Section 3103.1.2 Permit Required is deleted and the following inserted in lieu thereof: "3103.1.2
Permit required: All temporary structures that cover an area in excess of 750 sq. ft. shall not be erected,
operated, or maintained for any purpose without obtaining a permit from the Code Official. Exception: Tents
used exclusively for recreational camping purposes shall be exempt from the above requirements.

45. Chapter 31, Section 3109.1 General is amended by adding the following after the words Spa Code: “as adopted
& amended by the State of Maryland in COMAR 09.12.56”

46. Appendix G, FLOOD RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION, is hereby deleted and the Garrett County Floodplain
Management Ordinance is inserted in lieu thereof and incorporated into this Ordinance.

47. Appendix H SIGNS is hereby incorporated into this Ordinance.

Section 2. Status of building permits applied for prior to the effective date of this Ordinance

"This Ordinance shall not apply to buildings for which a permit is applied for prior to the effective date of this
Chapter."

ARTICLE Il. ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE BY REFERENCE

The International Residential Code, 2021 (hereinafter referred to as the Code) published by the International Code
Council, Inc, is hereby adopted and by reference thereto is made a part of this chapter with the same force and
effect as though set out in full herein, save and except such changes, amendments, revisions, deletions, substitutions
and/or additions as are specified in this chapter. If conflicts arise between this code and other codes adopted by
the State of Maryland or Garrett County, the more restrictive provisions shall govern.

At least one copy of this code and supplements thereto shall be on file and open for public use, examinations, and
inspections in the offices of the Garrett County Department of Community Development - Permits & Inspections
Division

Section 1. Modifications to International Residential Code:

1. Chapter 1, Section R101.1 Title is amended is amended by inserting "GARRETT COUNTY" as the “[NAME OF
JURISDICTION]".

2. Chapter 1, Section R101.2 Scope, Exception 3, 4 and 5 are each amended by deleting “five or fewer persons”
and inserting “eight or fewer persons”.



3.

10.
11.
12.

#1009 BE0538
R 5400 Y Mg
‘_i:ﬂ.s\d g 7 EAECYH O

SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION is hereby deleted and replaced with the following: “SCOPE AND
ADMINISTRATION. Chapter 1 of the International Building Code as amended within this ordinance shall apply
to the administration of the International Residential Code.”

Chapter 3, Table R301.2 CLIMATE AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA is to be completed by inserting the data
listed below and keyed to the table headings.

Ground snow load: 40 psf
Wind speed: 115 (mph)
Topographic effects: No
Special wind region: No
Wind-borne debris zone: No
Seismic design category: A
Weathering: Severe
Frost line depth: 36 inches
Termite: Moderate to Heavy
Ice barrier underlayment required: Yes
Flood Hazards: 3/2/89 —10/2/2013. FIRM Panel #'s available upon request
Air freezing index: 1309
. Mean annual Temp: 47.6
Elevation: 1948
Altitude correction factor: 0.98
Coincident wet bub: 70
Indoor winter design dry-bulb temperature: 70
Outdoor winter design dry-bulb temperature: 5
Heating temperature difference: 65
Latitude: 38 Degrees North
Daily Range: M
Indoor summer design relative humidity: 50%
. Summer design gains: 26
Indoor summer design dry-bulb temperature: 75
Outdoor summer design dry-bulb temperature: 83
Cooling temperature difference: 8

NS XS$<SEFVWIODTOS3 AT TR AOQ0 DT

Chapter 3, Table R302.6 DWELLING GARAGE SEPARATION is amended by deleting “%-inch gypsum board” in
all applicable sections and inserting “5/8-inch Type X gypsum board” in lieu thereof.

Chapter 3, Section R309.1 Floor surface is amended by adding a new sentence at the end as follows: "No point
on the finish garage floor of an attached garage shall be closer than four (4) inches to the finish floor level of the
dwelling.”

Chapter 3, Section R310.1 Emergency escape and rescue opening required is amended by deleting Exception
2.

Chapter 3, Section R310.5 Replacement windows for emergency escape and rescue openings is deleted in its
entirety.

Chapter 3, Section 310.6 Dwelling additions Exception 3 is deleted in its entirety.
Chapter 3, Section R310.7 Alterations or repairs of existing basement Exception is deleted in its entirety.
Chapter 3, Section R310.7.1 Existing emergency and escape rescue openings is deleted in its entirety.

Chapter 3, Section R313.2 One- and two-family dwelling automatic sprinkler systems is amended by adding
the following additional exception: “Exception 2. An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be
required in one- and two-family dwellings for a property not connected to an electrical utility.”



13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.
24.

25.

26.

BR009 BE0S539
Chapter 3, Section R317.1 Location required is amended by deleting from subsection 2 the words "and are less
than 8 inches (203 mm) from exposed ground" and by deleting from subsection 3 the words "unless separated
from such slab by an impervious moisture barrier.”

Section R322.1 General is deleted and ?’eplaced with the following: “General. Buildings and structures
constructed in whole or in part in flood hazard areas shall comply with the Garrett County Floodplain
Management Ordinance”. Sections R322.1.1 through R322.10 are deleted.

Chapter 3, Section R327.1 General is hereby amended by adding the following after the words Spa Code: “as
adopted & amended by the State of Maryland in COMAR 09.12.56”

Chapter 4, Section R401.3 Drainage is amended by deleting the last sentence and inserting the following in lieu
thereof: “The grade away from the foundation shall fall a minimum of 3 inches (77 mm) within the first 5 feet
(1524 mm), a slope of 5 percent." The Exception which follows is amended by deleting the words, "6 inches (152
mm) of fall within 10 feet (3048 mm)" and inserting the following in lieu thereof. "3 inches (77 mm) of fall within
5 feet (1524 mm)."

Chapter 4, Figure R403.1(2) PERMANENT WOOD.  FOUNDATION BASEMENT WALL SECTION is amended by
deleting the note "FINISH GRADE SLOPE %" PER FOOT MIN. 6 FT. FROM WALL" and inserting the following note
in lieu thereof "MINIMUM FINISH GRADE SLOPE 3" IN'5' FROM WALL”

Chapter 4, Figure R403.1(3) PERMANENT WOOD FOUNDATION CRAWL SPACE SECTION is amended by deleting
the note, "FINISH GRADE SLOPE % IN. PER FOOT MIN. 6 FT. FROM WALL" and inserting the following note in
lieu thereof "MINIMUM FINISH GRADE SLOPE 3" IN 5 FROM WALL."

Chapter 4, Section R405.1 Concrete or masonry foundations is amended by deleting the following from the
first sentence: “and enclose habitable or usable spaces located below grade.”

Chapter 4, Section R406.1 Concrete and masonry foundation dampproofing is amended by deleting “and
enclose interior spaces and floors below grade” from the first sentence and by deleting the last sentence and
inserting the following in lieu thereof "Concrete walls shall be dampproofed by applying any one of the above
listed dampproofing materials, any one of the waterproofing materials listed in Section R406.2, or any other
industry accepted product to the exterior of the wall.”

Chapter 4, Section R406.2 Concrete and masonry foundation waterproofing is amended by adding a new
sentence as follows, "Other industry accepted products which offer comparable waterproofing performance
may also be used."

Chapter 5, Section R502.1 General is amended by adding the following exception: "Exception: Lumber sold by
sawmills must be visually graded structural lumber evidenced by a stamp or certificate of inspection showing
species, grade, and moisture content."

Chapter 5, Section R507.3 Footings is amended by deleting Exception 2.

Chapter 6, Section R602.1 General is amended by adding the following exception: "Exception: Lumber sold by
sawmills must be visually graded structural lumber evidenced by a stamp or certificate of inspection showing
species, grade, and moisture content"

Chapter 8, Section R802.1 General is amended by adding the following exception: "Exception: Lumber sold by
sawmills must be visually graded structural lumber evidenced by stamp or certificate of inspection showing
species, grade, and moisture content."

Chapter 11, ENERGY EFFICIENCY is prefaced by the following note: “This Chapter is subject to the amendments
adopted in Public Safety Article Subtitle 12, Chapter 51, Maryland Building Performance Standards.”



J#R00 9 miioul

27. Part V-Mechanical, Chapters 12-23 are hereby prefaced by the following statement: “For the applicable
requirements concerning mechanical systems, refer to the Garrett County Mechanical Code and the mechanical
code adopted pursuant to the Business Regulation Article, 9A-205, Annotated Code of Maryland.”

28. Chapter 24 Fuel Gas is hereby prefaced by the following statement: “For the applicable requirements
concerning fuel gas, also refer to the Garrett County Plumbing Code Ordinance and the plumbing code adopted
pursuant to the Business Occupations and Professions Article, Title 12, Annotated Code of Maryland.”

29. Chapter 24, Section G2420.3.2 (409.3.2) Individual buildings is deleted and replaced with the following:
“Individual buildings. A shutoff valve shall be installed outdoors, above ground and within 10 feet of each
building, including at each building in a common system serving more than one building. Such shutoff valves
shall be readily accessible and visible to emergency personnel.”

30. Part VIl Plumbing, Chapters 25 through 33 are hereby prefaced by the following statement: “For the applicable
requirements concerning plumbing systems, refer to the Garrett County Plumbing Code Ordinance and the
plumbing code adopted pursuant to the Business Occupations and Professions Article, Title 12, Annotated Code
of Maryland.

31. Part Vill-Electrical, Chapters 34-43 are hereby prefaced by the following statement: “For the applicable
electrical requirements, refer to the Garrett County Electrical Code Ordinance and the National Electrical Code
as adopted and enforced by the State Fire Marshal pursuant to the provisions of the Public Safety Article, Title
12, Subtitle 6, Annotated Code of Maryland.”

32. Chapter 35 SERVICES, Section E3601.1 Scope Add a new as follows: "Section E3601.1.1 Additional references:
The installation of electrical services shall also be subject to the regulations of the power company serving the
area in which the service is to be installed”.

33. APPENDIX AC EXIT TERMINALS OF MECHANICAL DRAFT AND DIRECT-VENT VENTING SYSTEMS is hereby
incorporated into this Ordinance.

34. APPENDIX AE MANUFACTURED HOUSING USED AS DWELLINGS is hereby incorporated into this Ordinance.

35. APPENDIX AE, Section AE101.1 General is amended by deleting "(non-rental)"and inserting the words "or
rental" in lieu thereof.

36. APPENDIX AE, Section AE103 DEFINITIONS is amended by adding a new definition as follows: "RENTAL LOT. A
parcel of real estate inside a manufactured home rental community or other privately owned land where the
land and the manufactured home to be installed are not held in common ownership."

37. APPENDIX AQ TINY HOUSES is hereby incorporated into this Ordinance.

Section 2. Status of building permits applied for prior to the effective date of this Ordinance

"This Ordinance shall not apply to buildings for which a permit is applied for prior to the effective date of this
Chapter."

ARTICLE lll. ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE BY REFERENCE

The International Energy Conservation Code, 2021 (hereinafter referred to as the Code) published by the
International Code Council, Inc, is hereby adopted and by reference thereto is made a part of this chapter with the
same force and effect as though set out in full herein, save and except such changes, amendments, revisions,
deletions, substitutions and/or additions as are specified in this chapter. If conflicts arise between this code and
other codes adopted by the State of Maryland or Garrett County, the more restrictive provisions shall govern.

At least one copy of this code and supplements thereto shall be on file and open for public use, examinations, and
inspections in the offices of the Garrett County Department of Community Development Permits & Inspections
Division.



GERO09 MEDSL |

Section 1. Modifications to the International Energy Conservation Code

1.

The Code is prefaced by the following note: “This Code is subject to the amendments adopted in Public Safety
Article Subtitle 12, Chapter 51, Maryland Building Performance Standards.”

Chapter 1 [CE], Section C101.1 Title is amended is amended by inserting "GARRETT COUNTY" as the “[NAME OF
JURISDICTION]”.

Chapter 1 [CE], PART 2 - ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT is hereby deleted. (Refer to the provisions
within Chapter 1, International Building Code, as amended within this ordinance, for administration of the
International Energy Conservation Code).

Chapter 1 [RE], Section R101.1 Title is amended is amended by inserting "GARRETT COUNTY" as the “[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]".

Chapter 1 [RE], PART 2 - ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT is hereby deleted. (Refer to the provisions
within Chapter 1, International Building Code, as amended within this ordinance, for administration of the
International Energy Conservation Code).

Section 2. Status of building permits applied for prior to the effective date of this Ordinance

"This Ordinance shall not apply to buildings for which a permit is-applied for prior to the effective date of this
Chapter."

ARTICLE IV. SAVING CLAUSE

Nothing in this Ordinance or in the Code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceedings
impending in any Court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or
existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed, nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be
lost, impaired or effected by this ordinance.

NOW, THEREFORE, be it further enacted that this act shall become effective on the 1% day of November 2024.

WITNESS the corporate name of the BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND,
by Paul C. Edwards, its Chairman, attested to by Kevin G. Null, its County Administrator, this 7" day of October,
2024.

BOARD OF CO ISSIONERS OF

ULC EDWARDS Chalrman

s

RY.Z\N S. SAVAGE,Eounty Commissioner

S. LARRY %NELL, County Commissioner

ATTESHF:

KEVING.NuLL /
County Administrator



BERO09 BEOSL2
THE BOARD OF GARRETT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
203 South Fourth Street - Courthouse - Room 207 Oakland, Maryland 21550
www.garrettcountymd.gov countycommissioners@garrettcountymd.gov

301-334-8970 - . 301-895-3188 FAX 301-334-5000
Board of Commissioners County Administrator
Paul C. Edwards Kevin G. Null
Ryan S. Savage
S. {arry Tichngen County Attorney

MECHANICAL CODE ORDINANCE

Adoption of the 2018 International Mechanical Code &
establishment of Mechanical Permits and Inspections.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND, A BODY POLITIC
AND CORPORATE AND A POLITICAL SUBDIVISION OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND, CREATING THE GARRETT COUNTY
MECHANICAL CODE (THE "MECHANICAL CODE”) TO THE PROVISIONS OF THE GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND
CODE OF ORDINANCES; REGULATING AND PROVIDING MINIMUM STANDARDS GOVERNING THE INSTALLATION
OF HEATING, VENTILATION, AIR CONDITIONING AND REFRIGERATION SYSTEMS; PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE
OF MECHANICAL PERMITS, FEES AND INSPECTIONS; AND PROVIDING PENALTIES FOR VIOLATION THEREOF.

EXPLANATION

WHEREAS, Title 9A of the Maryland Business Regulations has created a State Board of Heating, Ventilation, Air-
Conditioning, and Refrigeration Contractors and established a licensing program and standards for individuals who
provide or assist in providing heating, ventilation, air-conditioning, and refrigeration services, and

WHEREAS, the Code of Maryland Regulations, Subtitle 15, Chapter 09.15.05 specifies that the Mechanical
Code in the State of Maryland shall be the 2018 International Mechanical Code (IMC-18), and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County, Maryland (the "County") has determined
that the adoption and implementation of this Mechanical Code is necessary to promote the health, safety and
welfare of the citizens of Garrett County; and

WHEREAS, the County has determined what local amendments to the 2018 International Mechanical Code are
necessary or desirable for Garrett County and have reviewed the comments on these amendments received in
writing and at public hearing.

NOW, THEREFORE, be it enacted and ordained by the Board of County Commissioners of Garrett County,
Maryland, a body politic and Corporate and a political subdivision of the State of Maryland do hereby enact the
following ordinance with amendments to be included within the County Code of Ordinance, Title XV, Chapter 150,
Section 150.07.

ARTICLE I. ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE BY REFERENCE

The International Mechanical Code 2018 (herein referred to as the "Code") published by the International Code
Council is hereby adopted and by reference thereto is made a part of this chapter with the same force and effect
as though set out in full herein save and except such changes, amendments, revisions, deletions, substitutions
and/or additions as are specified in this chapter. If conflicts arise between this Code and other codes adopted by
the State or County, the more restrictive provision shall govern. At least one copy of this code and supplements
thereto shall be on file and open for public use, examination, and inspection in the Office of the Clerk to the Board
of County Commissioners.

Section 1. Modifications to the International Mechanical Code
(1) Chapter 1, Section 101.1 Title is amended to add “Garrett County” as the “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]".

(2) Chapter 1, Section 103.1 General is deleted and the following inserted in lieu thereof: “103.1 General: The
code official shall be the authorized employee(s) within the Garrett County Department of Community



[T 4;-‘_"~ft ok |

JHROO G B&EOOL3
Development, Permits & Inspections Division administering and enforcing mechanical codes in Garrett
County.”

(3)  Section 106.4.3 Expiration is amended by deleting “commenced within 180 days” and inserting
“commenced within one year” and by deleting “for a period of 180 days” and inserting “for a period of
one year”.

(4) Section 106.4.4 Extensions is amended by deleting “for a period not exceeding 180 days” and inserting
“for a period not exceeding one year”

(5) Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule is amended to read as follows “106.5.2 Fee schedule. The fees for mechanical
work shall be paid as established by the fee schedule adopted by the Board of Garrett County
Commissioners.”

(6) Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds is deleted.

(7)  Section 108.4 Violation penalties is deleted and the following inserted in lieu thereof: “Violation
penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the
requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair mechanical work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate issued
under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine established by the
fee schedule adopted by the Board of Garrett County Commissioners. Each day that a violation continues
after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.”

(8) Section 108.5 Stop work orders is amended by deleting “of a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or
worth more than [AMOUNT] and inserting “of a fine established by the fee schedule adopted by the Board
of Garrett County Commissioners”

(9) Section 109.1 Application for appeal is amended by replacing “board of appeals” with “the Building Code
Board of Appeals as appointed by the Garrett County Commissioners”

(10) Section 109.2 Membership of board regarding Membership of board is deleted in its entirety
(11) Section 1101.10 Locking access port caps is deleted in its entirety.

ARTICLE Il. _SAVING CLAUSE

Nothing in this Ordinance or in the Code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceedings
impending in any Court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or
existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed, nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character
be lost, impaired or effected by this ordinance.

NOW, THEREFORE, be it further enacted that this act shall become effective on the 1% day of November 2024.

WITNESS the corporate name of the BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF GARRETT COUNTY, MARYLAND,
by Paul C. Edwards, its Chairman, attested to by Kevin G. Null, its County Administrator, this 7" day of October,
2024.

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF

PA'(TLc EDWARDS, Chairman

(SEAL)

RYAN S. SAVAGE, County Commissioner

Aﬁz/ B e W

S. LARRY y(HNELL, County Commissioner

KEVIN G. NULL
County Administrator



